
Project Mgr.: Liz DeLeon
Date Posted: 11-14-08
Date Due: 12-3-08

BID #09-5152
"Imm Rd from Tamiami Trl N to Strand Blvd Landscp Maint"

Addendums:  3
MATH CORRECTED 

(FINAL REVISED TAB)

Notices Sent: 345
Packages Requested:  44

Bids Received:  7

NUMBER DESCRIPTION QUANTITYUNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 Weeding (min. per week cost $150) 52 Ea $1,400.00 $72,800.00 $231.75 $12,051.00
2 General Site Pruning 52 Ea $175.00 $9,100.00 $77.30 $4,019.60
3 Weekly Irrigation Systems Functions (min. per week $200) 52 Ea $300.00 $15,600.00 $200.00 $10,400.00
4 Trash Removal 52 Ea $165.00 $8,580.00 $58.00 $3,016.00
5 Street Cleaning 52 Ea $150.00 $7,800.00 $154.00 $8,008.00

CANOPY TREE AND PALM PRUNING
Canopy Trees: - (April - September)

6 Live Oak 18 Ea $1.00 $18.00 $1.00 $18.00
7 Japanese Privet 14 Ea $1.00 $14.00 $1.00 $14.00

Palms - (June)
8 Cabbage Palm 39 Ea $18.00 $702.00 $17.30 $674.70

9 8-2-12 (Four times a yr.; Unit Price per bag)  192 Ea $5.00 $960.00 $3.40 $652.80
10 So-Po-Mag 9 Ea $5.00 $45.00 $5.00 $45.00
11 Perform Sequestrene Iron Drench Application 1 Ea $400.00 $400.00 $200.00 $200.00
12 20-20-20 with Ferromec AC 13-0-0 plus 6% Iron (Optional) 1 Ea $100.00 $100.00 $150.00 $150.00

ORNAMENTAL SPRAYING (Min. per application $200)
13 Groundcover, Shrubs, & Trees: Insecticides & Fungicides 1 Ea $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $200.00 $200.00
14 Herbicides 1 Ea $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $200.00 $200.00

MULCHING

13254 Ea $1.00 $13,254.00 $0.92 $12,193.68
LANE CLOSURE - Maintenance of Traffic to be included in unit pricing
PRESSURE CLEANING BRICK PAVERS

16 A. Pressure Cleaning 1 Ea $100.00 $100.00 $168.00 $168.00
17 Mulch - Turn and mix prior to apply mulch 1 LS $200.00 $200.00 $1,544.00 $1,544.00

$132,073.00 $53,554.78

A.1 Side Right-of-Way Mowing 26 $150.00 $3,900.00 $225.00 $5,850.00

26 $25.00 $650.00 $375.00 $9,750.00
A. 3 Planting Services

Vila & Son Landscaping 
CorporationRenfroe Jackson, Inc.Juniper Landscaping, Inc.

NONRESPONSIVE

Hannula Landscaping and 
Irrigation, Inc.Avant-Yard, Inc.

Elan Lawn & Landscape                     
Services, Inc.

Florida Land Maintenance, Inc. 
d/b/a Commerical Land 

Maintenance

SECTION I: BASIC MAINTENANCE FUNCTIONS

TOTAL BASE BID
ALTERNATE:   The award will be based on the base bid plus alternate (if 

A. 2
Unimproved Area: Price shall include street cleaning after 
mowing, trash pick-up and disposal, edging and mowing.

These services shall be activated in the event that damaged or dead plant material requires replacement and/or landscape areas require minor renovations.  Quotes requested for items under this Section generally shall be for small quantities. The Contractor shall bid installed Unit prices which shall include materials and labor required for the installation, 
MOT, initial watering and establishment hand watering (provided the irrigation system is not providing proper coverage), mulch, removal and disposal fee (if applicable)of existing plant material and a one year warranty on all new materials. Two bubblers per tree / palm shall be included in price.  All plant material provided shall be Florida #1 or better as 
specified by the Department of Agriculture's "Grades and Standards for Nursery Plants" Volumes I & II latest edition.

15

SECTION II: SITE SPECIFIC MAINTENANCE FUNCTIONS FOR WORK AREA 1:

FERTILIZATION (County will supply granular fertilizer) 
Turf, Groundcover, Shrubs, and Trees

Organic Application (Calculated using 133,151 SF 
coverage (2" mulch, 2 cu. ft. bags, 821.6 CY)

NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVENONRESPONSIVE
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Project Mgr.: Liz DeLeon
Date Posted: 11-14-08
Date Due: 12-3-08

BID #09-5152
"Imm Rd from Tamiami Trl N to Strand Blvd Landscp Maint"

Addendums:  3
MATH CORRECTED 

(FINAL REVISED TAB)

Notices Sent: 345
Packages Requested:  44

Bids Received:  7

NUMBER DESCRIPTION QUANTITYUNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 Plumbago 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $3.00 $3.00
2 Coontie 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $6.00 $6.00
3 Crown of thorn 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $4.00 $4.00
4 Juniper 'Parsonil' 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $3.50 $3.50
5 Bougainvillea 'Helen Johnson' 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $4.00 $4.00
6 Green island ficus 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $3.50 $3.50
7 Liriope 'Evergreen giant' 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $3.00 $3.00
8 Muhly grass 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $3.00 $3.00
9 Ground Orchids 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $9.00 $9.00
10 Crown of Thorn 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $4.00 $4.00
11 Asian jasmine 'Minima' 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $3.00 $3.00
12 Bougainvillea 'Silhouette' 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $4.00 $4.00
13 Big Rose 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $4.00 $4.00
14 Ilex 'Schellings dwarf' 1 Ea $8.00 $8.00 $4.00 $4.00

15 Dwarf Firebush 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $7.20 $7.20
16 Thryallis 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $6.00 $6.00
17 Bougainvillea 'silhouette' 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $8.50 $8.50
18 Allamanda Hendersonii Dwarf 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $6.80 $6.80
19 Bougainvillea 'Helen Johnson' 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $8.80 $8.80
20 Ixora 'Nora Grant' 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $6.40 $6.40
21 Indian Hawthorne 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $6.80 $6.80
22 Juniper 'Parsoni' 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $6.80 $6.80
23 Variegated arboricola 'Trinette' 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $8.00 $8.00
24 Dwarf bougainvillea 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $8.00 $8.00
25 Ground orchids 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $12.80 $12.80
26 Plumbago 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $6.00 $6.00
27 Saw Palmetto 1 Ea $35.00 $35.00 $19.00 $19.00
28 Ilex 'Schellings dwarf' 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $6.80 $6.80
29 Indian hawthorne 'Alba', white 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $6.80 $6.80
30 Crown of Thorn 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $7.00 $7.00
31 Dwarf Ixora 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $7.00 $7.00
32 Zanadu 1 Ea $18.00 $18.00 $9.00 $9.00

Hannula Landscaping and 
Irrigation, Inc. Juniper Landscaping, Inc. Renfroe Jackson, Inc.

Vila & Son Landscaping 
CorporationAvant-Yard, Inc.

Elan Lawn & Landscape                     
Services, Inc.

Florida Land Maintenance, Inc. 
d/b/a Commerical Land 

Maintenance

Plants
1 Gallon Container

3 Gallon Container
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Project Mgr.: Liz DeLeon
Date Posted: 11-14-08
Date Due: 12-3-08

BID #09-5152
"Imm Rd from Tamiami Trl N to Strand Blvd Landscp Maint"

Addendums:  3
MATH CORRECTED 

(FINAL REVISED TAB)

Notices Sent: 345
Packages Requested:  44

Bids Received:  7

NUMBER DESCRIPTION QUANTITYUNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

33 Bottlebrush 'Red cluster' 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $40.00
34 Cardboard Palm 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $55.00 $55.00
35 Cattley Guava 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $30.00 $30.00
36 Crinum Lily 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $40.00
37 Crape Myrtle 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $30.00 $30.00
38 Hibiscus Standard 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $30.00 $30.00
39 Jamaican Caper 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $48.00 $48.00
40 Ligustrum 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $30.00 $30.00
41 Myrsine 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00
42 Silver Buttonwood 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $40.00
43 Simpson or Spanish Stopper 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $40.00
44 Sabal mionor 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $60.00 $60.00
45 Variegated Pittosporum 1 Ea $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $40.00

46 Red Maple 1 Ea $65.00 $65.00 $56.00 $56.00
47 Black Olive 'Shady Lady' 1 Ea $65.00 $65.00 $56.00 $56.00
48 Floss Silk Tree 1 Ea $65.00 $65.00 $60.00 $60.00
49 Yellow Poinciana 1 Ea $65.00 $65.00 $120.00 $120.00
50 Bald Cypress 1 Ea $65.00 $65.00 $60.00 $60.00
51 Hong Kong Orchid 1 Ea $65.00 $65.00 $80.00 $80.00

52 Bottlebrush 'Red Cluster' 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $105.00 $105.00
53 Silver Buttonwood 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00
54 Crape Myrtle 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $140.00 $140.00
55 Dahoon Holly 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00
56 Holly 'East Palatka' 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $140.00 $140.00
57 Foxtail Palm 1 Ea $190.00 $190.00 $190.00 $190.00
58 Ligustrum 1 Ea $160.00 $160.00 $160.00 $160.00
59 Live Oak 1 Ea $190.00 $190.00 $140.00 $140.00
60 Magnolia 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $145.00 $145.00
61 Red Maple 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $90.00 $90.00
62 Tabebuia 'Ipe' 1 Ea $140.00 $140.00 $130.00 $130.00
63 Wax Myrtle 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $105.00 $105.00
64 Orchid Tree (White) 1 Ea $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00

Hannula Landscaping and 
Irrigation, Inc. Juniper Landscaping, Inc. Renfroe Jackson, Inc.

Vila & Son Landscaping 
CorporationAvant-Yard, Inc.

Elan Lawn & Landscape                     
Services, Inc.

Florida Land Maintenance, Inc. 
d/b/a Commerical Land 

Maintenance

25 Gallon Container

10 Gallon Container

15 Gallon Container
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Project Mgr.: Liz DeLeon
Date Posted: 11-14-08
Date Due: 12-3-08

BID #09-5152
"Imm Rd from Tamiami Trl N to Strand Blvd Landscp Maint"

Addendums:  3
MATH CORRECTED 

(FINAL REVISED TAB)

Notices Sent: 345
Packages Requested:  44

Bids Received:  7

NUMBER DESCRIPTION QUANTITYUNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

65 Silver Buttonwood 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $200.00 $200.00
66 Crape Myrtle 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $240.00 $240.00
67 Dahoon Holly 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $240.00 $240.00
68 Holly 'East Palatka' 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $280.00 $280.00
69 Foxtail Palm 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $280.00 $280.00
70 Ligustrum 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $240.00 $240.00
71 Live Oak 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $280.00 $280.00
72 Magnolia 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $290.00 $290.00
73 Red Maple 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $260.00 $260.00
74 Tabebuia 'Ipe' 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $290.00 $290.00
75 Wax Myrtle 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $240.00 $240.00
76 Orchid Tree (White) 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $290.00 $290.00

77 Silver Buttonwood 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $175.00 $175.00
78 Crape Myrtle 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $225.00 $225.00
79 Dahoon Holly 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $300.00 $300.00
80 Holly 'East Palatka' 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $300.00 $300.00
81 Foxtail Palm 1 Ea $500.00 $500.00 $250.00 $250.00
82 Ligustrum 1 Ea $500.00 $500.00 $280.00 $280.00
83 Live Oak 1 Ea $500.00 $500.00 $300.00 $300.00
84 Magnolia 'DD Blanchard' 1 Ea $500.00 $500.00 $300.00 $300.00
85 Magnolia 'Little Gem' 1 Ea $500.00 $500.00 $310.00 $310.00
86 Shady Lady Black Olive 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $320.00 $320.00
87 Rain Tree 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $180.00 $180.00
88 Tabebuia 'Ipe' 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $250.00 $250.00
89 Wax Myrtle 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $200.00 $200.00
90 Bald Cypress 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $300.00 $300.00
91 Hong Kong Orchid 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $290.00 $290.00
92 Orchid Tree (White) 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $300.00 $300.00

Vila & Son Landscaping 
CorporationAvant-Yard, Inc.

Florida Land Maintenance, Inc. 
d/b/a Commerical Land 

Maintenance
Hannula Landscaping and 

Irrigation, Inc. Juniper Landscaping, Inc. Renfroe Jackson, Inc.

45 Gallon Container

65 Gallon Container
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Elan Lawn & Landscape                     
Services, Inc.
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Project Mgr.: Liz DeLeon
Date Posted: 11-14-08
Date Due: 12-3-08

BID #09-5152
"Imm Rd from Tamiami Trl N to Strand Blvd Landscp Maint"

Addendums:  3
MATH CORRECTED 

(FINAL REVISED TAB)

Notices Sent: 345
Packages Requested:  44

Bids Received:  7

NUMBER DESCRIPTION QUANTITYUNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

93 Live Oak 100 gal. 1 Ea $800.00 $800.00 $560.00 $560.00
94 Live Oak 200 gal. 1 Ea $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $900.00 $900.00
95 Live Oak 300 gal. 1 Ea $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,900.00 $1,900.00
96 Hong Kong Orchid / 10'-12' 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00
97 Hong Kong Orchid / 14'-20' OA 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $225.00 $225.00
98 Hong Kong Orchid / 15'-35' OA 1 Ea $500.00 $500.00 $350.00 $350.00
99 Alexander Palm / 8'-10' OA 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $90.00 $90.00

100 Alexander Palm / 10'-16' OA 1 Ea $600.00 $600.00 $240.00 $240.00
101 Coconut Palm / 10'-15' GW 1 Ea $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $800.00 $800.00
102 Coconut Palm / Larger sizes, cost per foot of wood 1 Ea $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00
103 Foxtail Palm / FG 8'-10' 1 Ea $350.00 $350.00 $145.00 $145.00
104 Foxtail Palm / FG 10'-15' OA 1 Ea $600.00 $600.00 $290.00 $290.00
105 Foxtail Palm / Larger sizes, cost per foot of wood 1 Ea $150.00 $150.00 $25.00 $25.00
106 Royal Palm / 7'-10' GW 1 Ea $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00
107 Royal Palm / 12'-16' GW 1 Ea $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $800.00 $800.00
108 Royal Palm / Larger sizes, cost per foot of wood 1 Ea $150.00 $150.00 $125.00 $125.00
109 Sabal Palm / 10' -18' OA 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $110.00 $110.00
110 Thatch Palm / 6' - 8' OA 1 Ea $500.00 $500.00 $150.00 $150.00
111 Thatch Palm / Larger sizes, cost per foot of wood 1 Ea $200.00 $200.00 $60.00 $60.00
112 Wax Myrtle / 10' OA 1 Ea $150.00 $150.00 $75.00 $75.00
113 Wax Myrtle / 12' OA 1 Ea $175.00 $175.00 $100.00 $100.00
114 Wax Myrtle / 14' OA 1 Ea $200.00 $200.00 $120.00 $120.00
115 Crape Myrtle 'Muskogee' / 8' - 10' OA 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $135.00 $135.00
116 Crape Myrtle 'Muskogee' / 10' - 14' OA 1 Ea $400.00 $400.00 $200.00 $200.00
117 Crape Myrtle 'Natchez' / 8' - 10' OA 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $135.00 $135.00
118 Crape Myrtle 'Natchez' / 10' - 14' OA 1 Ea $400.00 $400.00 $200.00 $200.00
119 Crape Myrtle 'Tuscarora' / 8' -10'  OA 1 Ea $300.00 $300.00 $135.00 $135.00
120 Crape Myrtle 'Tuscarora' / 10' - 14' OA 1 Ea $400.00 $400.00 $200.00 $200.00
121 Magnolia 'DD Blanchard' / 100 gal. 1 Ea $750.00 $750.00 $425.00 $425.00
122 Magnolia 'Little Gem' / 100 gal. 1 Ea $750.00 $750.00 $425.00 $425.00
123 Shady Lady Black Olive / 10' - 18'OA 1 Ea $400.00 $400.00 $240.00 $240.00
124 Shady Lady Black Olive / 16' -20'OA 1 Ea $500.00 $500.00 $290.00 $290.00
125 Bald Cypress / 100 gal. 1 Ea $750.00 $750.00 $425.00 $425.00

Renfroe Jackson, Inc.

Various Sizes

Elan Lawn & Landscape                     
Services, Inc.

Vila & Son Landscaping 
CorporationAvant-Yard, Inc.

Florida Land Maintenance, Inc. 
d/b/a Commerical Land 

Maintenance
Hannula Landscaping and 

Irrigation, Inc. Juniper Landscaping, Inc.
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Project Mgr.: Liz DeLeon
Date Posted: 11-14-08
Date Due: 12-3-08

BID #09-5152
"Imm Rd from Tamiami Trl N to Strand Blvd Landscp Maint"

Addendums:  3
MATH CORRECTED 

(FINAL REVISED TAB)

Notices Sent: 345
Packages Requested:  44

Bids Received:  7

NUMBER DESCRIPTION QUANTITYUNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

126 Irrigation Supervisor (per man hour): 1 Hr $65.00 $65.00 $35.00 $35.00
127 Irrigation Technician (per man hour): 1 Hr $55.00 $55.00 $35.00 $35.00
128 Laborer/Helper (per man hour): 1 Hr $45.00 $45.00 $28.00 $28.00
129 Irrigation System Review; Unit per hour 1 Hr $50.00 $50.00 $45.00 $45.00
130 Staking of Small Palm (4"-6" Caliper)                                                          1 Ea $90.00 $90.00 $15.00 $15.00
131 Staking Large Palms (Caliper greater than 6") 1 Ea $125.00 $125.00 $20.00 $20.00

132
Staking Small Canopy Tree (2x2 posts and guy wire, 4"-6" 
caliper) 1 Ea $90.00 $90.00 $15.00 $15.00

133 Staking Large Canopy Tree (2x4 posts, greater than 6" caliper) 1 Ea $125.00 $125.00 $17.00 $17.00
134 Restanding and Staking Small Palm (4"-6" Caliper) 1 Ea $225.00 $225.00 $35.00 $35.00

135 Restanding and Staking Large Palms (Caliper greater than 6") 1 Ea $250.00 $250.00 $75.00 $75.00

136
Restanding and Staking Small Canopy Tree (2x2 posts and guy 
wire, 4"-6" caliper) 1 Ea $225.00 $225.00 $35.00 $35.00

137 Restaking Large Canopy Tree (2x4 posts, greater than 6" caliper) 1 Ea $250.00 $250.00 $50.00 $50.00

TOTAL MEN (Crew Size) TO PERFORM SERVICES
(Minimum one 8 person crew required per week)

Juniper Landscaping, Inc. Renfroe Jackson, Inc.
Vila & Son Landscaping 

Corporation

Opened by:  Michael F. Hauer       

Witness:  Courtney Grosman 

Prompt Payment Terms: _____%  _____ Days;  Net _____ Days

Local Vendor:  (Yes/No)

Addendum Acknowledged:  (Yes/No)

(The contractor shall submit the amount of man-hours that they 
intend to provide to this Contract on a weekly basis)

Avant-Yard, Inc.
Elan Lawn & Landscape                     

Services, Inc.

Florida Land Maintenance, Inc. 
d/b/a Commerical Land 

Maintenance

ESTIMATED TOTAL MAN- HOURS TO PERFORM 
REQUIRED SERVICES

Per Week:
Annual (52)

General Services

TOTAL BASE BID  + ALTERNATE

Hannula Landscaping and 
Irrigation, Inc.

Yes No

$170,146.00 $90,525.48

Net 30 Days No Bid

Yes Yes

This is a preliminary summary of the bids as they were opened and announced at the bid opening. Bid prices have not been verified and are subject to change in the event mathematical errors are discovered during bid review.  Other information contained in this summary is also subject to review.

Hours per week
Crew size (Personnel on Site)

Man Hours

10 No Bid
520 No Bid

16 No Bid
10 No Bid

160 No Bid
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