Prjct Mgr: Mark Rothenberger
Date Posted: 11/13/08
Date Due: 12/4/08

"Bid #09-5161 Purchase Delivery of Metal Polyethylene Pipe"

Notice Sent: 161
Packages Downloaded: 25
Bids Received: 5

Contech HD Supply
Ferguson Coast Pump & | Construction Waterworks, | Metal Culverts,
Waterworks Supply Co. Products, Inc. Ltd. Inc.
CORRUGATED | CORRUGATED | CORRUGATED SUPER- CORRUGATED
SMOOTH SMOOTH SMOOTH CORRUGATED SMOOTH
POLYETHYLENE PIPE DIAMETER _|Unit WALLED WALLED WALLED SMOOTH WALLED
12 in. Round ft b 421§ 4.38 | No Bid b 5.67 | No Bid
15 in. Round ft b 5.68 | § 5.91 [ No Bid b 8.13 [ No Bid
18 in. Round ft b 7.15 ] § 7.44 | No Bid b 9.83 | No Bid
24 in. Round ft b 12.13 [ ¢ 12.65 | No Bid b 18.00 | No Bid
30 in. Round ft b 17.37 [ ¢ 18.11 | No Bid b 24.47 | No Bid
36 in. Round ft b 22.61 | § 23.57 | No Bid b 30.60 | No Bid
12 in. Band ea b 4.21 ] ¢ 4.38 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 in. Band ea b 5.68 | ¢ 5.91 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 in. Band ea b 7.15 ] ¢ 7.44 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 in. Band ea b 12.13 | ¢ 12.65 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
30.in. Band ea b 17.37 | ¢ 18.11 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 in. Band ea b 22.61 | § 23.57 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Additional Bands No Bid No Bid No Bid Varies No Bid
Qualified Price
A-2000 PVC Pipe (18") ft $ 12.20 |Not Acceptable | $ 13.74 | No Bid No Bid
Qualified Price
A-2000 PVC Pipe (24") ft $ 19.66 |Not Acceptable | $ 20.93 | No Bid No Bid
Qualified Price
A-2000 PVC Pipe (30") ft $ 27.83 [Not Acceptable | $ 31.92 | No Bid No Bid
Qualified Price
A-2000 PVC Pipe (36") ft $ 39.20 [Not Acceptable | $ 45.78 | No Bid No Bid
Ferguson Waterworks Coast Pump & Supply Co. Contech Construction Products, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. Metal Culverts, Inc.
ASPHALT ASPHALT
COATED COATED
GALVANIZED GALVANIZED
ASPHALT ASPHALT ASPHALT *ALUMINZED *ALUMINZED
GALVANIZED COATED GALVANIZED COATED GALVANIZED COATED GALVANIZED AS GALVANIZED AS
STEEL GALVANIZED ALUMINUM STEEL GALVANIZED | ALUMINUM STEEL GALVANIZED | ALUMINUM STEEL ALTERNATE | ALUMINUM STEEL ALTERNATE | ALUMINUM
12 in. Round ft b 7.61]% 958 ($ 8.29 [No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 765(% 9.63($ 8.33 | § 9.73 | § 10.09 | $ 10.24 | ¢ 7301%$ 7571% 7.68
15 in. Round ft b 8.92 | § 1115 $ 11.49 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 897 (% 1121 $ 11.55 | ¢ 12.24 | ¢ 1269 | $ 12.48 | ¢ 9.18 | $ 952 1% 9.36
18 in. Round ft b 10.94 | ¢ 1379 | $ 14.62 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 11.00 | $ 1386 | $ 14.70 | ¢ 14.55 | ¢ 15.08 | $ 15.04 | ¢ 1091 $ 1131 1% 11.28
24 in. Round ft b 14.25 | ¢ 1795 | $ 19.10 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 1432 1% 18.04 | $ 19.20 | ¢ 19.47 | ¢ 2017 ($ 19.84 | ¢ 14.60 | $ 1513 | $ 14.88
30 in. Round ft b 19.90 | ¢ 2507 ($ 28.85 [No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 20.00 [ $ 2520 $ 29.00 | § 30.07 | § 3117 ($ 30.72 | § 2255 (% 23.38($ 23.04
36 in. Round ft b 26.36 | § 3321 (% 33.82 [No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 2650 [ $ 33.39($ 34.00 | § 35.87 | § 3717 $ 36.80 | § 2690 [ $ 2788 (% 27.60
42 in. Round ft b 42.78 | § 5390 [ $ 56.70 [No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 43.00]$ 5418 [ $ 57.00 | § 58.93 | § 61.09($ 59.52 | § 44201 $ 4582 1$ 44.64
48 in. Round ft b 47.75 | § 60.17 [ $ 64.66 [No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 48.00 | $ 60.48 [ $ 65.00 | § 67.13 | § 6959 [ $ 67.84 | § 50.35($ 5219 ($ 50.88
60 in. Round ft b 72.62 | § 9451 ($ 101.47 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 73.00($ 95.00 [$ 102.00 | 9 107.69 | ¢ 11164 | $  108.48 | ¢ 80.77 [ $ 83.73($ 81.36
ASPHALT ASPHALT ASPHALT ASPHALT ASPHALT
GALVANIZED COATED GALVANIZED COATED GALVANIZED COATED GALVANIZED COATED GALVANIZED COATED
STEEL GALVANIZED ALUMINUM STEEL GALVANIZED | ALUMINUM STEEL GALVANIZED | ALUMINUM STEEL GALVANIZED | ALUMINUM STEEL GALVANIZED | ALUMINUM
12 in. Band ea |$ 10.94 | ¢ 13.68 | $ 16.91 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 11.00 | $ 13751 $ 17.00 | ¢ 14.60 | ¢ 1513 | $ 15.36 | ¢ 1095 | $ 1135 $ 11.52
15 in. Band ea |$ 12.93 | ¢ 16.17 | $ 17.91 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 13.00 | $ 16.25 | $ 18.00 | ¢ 18.36 | ¢ 19.04 | $ 18.72 | ¢ 13.77 1% 14.28 | $ 14.04
18 in. Band ea |$ 15.92 | ¢ 19.90 | $ 19.90 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 16.00 | $ 20.00 [ $ 20.00 | § 21.83 | § 2263 (% 22.56 | § 1637 $ 16.97 | $ 16.92
24 in. Band ea |$ 20.89 | § 2611 ($ 27.85 [No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 21.00($ 26.25($ 28.00 | § 29.20 | § 3027 ($ 29.76 | § 2190 $ 2270 $ 22.32
30.in. Band ea |$ 26.86 | § 3358 (% 41.13 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 27.00($ 33.75($ 41.00 | § 45.13 | § 46.76 | $ 46.08 | § 33.85($ 3507 (% 24.56
36 in. Band ea |$ 38.80 | § 4850 | $ 49.79 |No Bid No Bid No Bid E: 39.00($ 48751 $ 50.00 | § 53.80 | § 55.76 | $ 55.20 | § 40351 $ 4182 1$ 41.40




Prjct Mgr: Mark Rothenberger “Bid #09-5161 Purchase Delivery of Metal Polyethylene Pipe" Notice Sent: 161

Date Posted: 11/13/08 Packages Downloaded: 25
Date Due: 12/4/08 Bids Received: 5
Ferguson Waterworks Coast Pump & Supply Co. Contech Construction Products, Inc. HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. Metal Culverts, Inc.
42 in. Band ea |$ 79.59 | § 99.48 | $ 134.30 |No Bid No Bid No Bid g 80.00 | $ 100.00 | $  135.00 | ¢ 147.33 | § 152.73 |$ 148.80 | 9 11050 | $ 11455|$ 111.60
48 in. Band ea |$ 99.48 | § 124351 $ 139.27 |No Bid No Bid No Bid g 100.00 | $ 125.00 | $  140.00 | ¢ 167.84 | § 17397 |$  169.60 | 9 12588 | $ 13048 |$ 127.20
60 in. Band ea |$ 139.27 | § 174.09 | $ 159.17 |No Bid No Bid No Bid g 140.00 | $ 175.00|$  160.00 | ¢ 269.27 | § 279.11 ($ 271.20 | ¢ 20195 $ 209.33 [ $ 203.40
6 in. Bolts & Nuts ea |$ 26.00 | § 26.00 | $ 26.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid g 0.87 | ¢ 087 1% 0.87 | ¢ 0.65|9% 0.65]9% 0.65
8 in. Bolts & Nuts ea |$ 32.00 | § 3200 | $ 32.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid g 1.13 | 9 1.13($ 1.13 | 9 085]% 085]% 0.85
Additional Bands No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid g 1.13 | 9 1.13($ 1.13 | 9 085]% 085]% 0.85
Flat Aluminum Bands with 7:
Neoprene One Piece Gaskets No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reinforced Concrete Oval 18" ft b 29.30 | § 23.61 No Bid| ¢ 30.80 No Bid
Reinforced Concrete Oval 24" ft b 46.47 | 9 38.50 No Bid| ¢ 48.80 No Bid
Reinforced Concrete Oval 30" ft b 64.87 | § 54.22 No Bid| ¢ 68.13 No Bid
Reinforced Concrete Oval 36" ft b 92.93 | § 77.61 No Bid| ¢ 97.60 No Bid
Reinforced Concrete Round 18" ft b 16.60 | ¢ 20.62 No Bid| ¢ 19.07 No Bid
Reinforced Concrete Round 24" ft b 26.33 | § 31.27 No Bid| ¢ 28.87 No Bid
Reinforced Concrete Round 30" ft b 39.47 | § 44.50 No Bid| ¢ 41.13 No Bid
Reinforced Concrete Round 36" ft b 57.53 | § 62.21 No Bid| ¢ 67.53 No Bid
Local Vendor Preference: Y Y N N N
Insurance Certificate: Y Y Y Y Y
Agent: Jack Curran
Witness: Carol Ropp




