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Paints & Coatings, Inc.
Chaz Equipment 
Company, Inc.

B MANHOLE/LIFT STATION/WET WELL
REHABILITATION BY SEAL AND COAT METHOD

B1
Manhole/Lift Station/Wet Well Rehabilitation by Sealing 
and Coating with Resin

B 1.1 Seal and Coat Manhole/Lift Station - 48" Diameter VF 251.20$                          No Bid
B 1.2 Seal and Coat Manhole/Lift Station - 60" Diameter VF 376.80$                          No Bid

B2
Lift Station and Wet Well Surface Rehabilitation by Sealing 
and Coating with Resin

B 2.1 Seal and Coat Lift Station/Wet Wells - Surface Rehabilitation SF 22.00$                            No Bid

B3 Mobilization/Demobilization

B 3.1
Mobilization/Demobilization if less than 10 manholes or less 
than 750 SF per job work order EA No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY B TOTAL 650.00$                          No Bid

C
MANHOLE/LIFT STATION REHABILITATION BY 
CEMENTITIOUS LINING

C1 Manhole/Lift Station Rehabilitation By Cementitious Lining 
C 1.1 Cementitious Lining of Manhole/Lift Station - 48" Diameter VF No Bid 295.00$                     
C 1.2 Cementitious Lining of Manhole/Lift Station - 60" Diameter VF No Bid 297.00$                     

C2 Lift Station Surface Rehabilitation by Cementitious Lining 
C 2.1 Cementitious Lining Rehabilitation of Lift Station Surface SF No Bid 30.00$                       

C3 Mobilization/Demobilization

C 3.1
Mobilization/Demobilization if less than 10 manholes or less 
than 750 SF per job work order EA No Bid 1.00$                         
CATEGORY C TOTAL No Bid 623.00$                     

D SEWER BYPASS
D1 Bypass Pump Setup with Bypass Piping
D 1.1 Bypass 8" Sewer Setup EA 1,500.00$                       3,000.00$                  
D 1.2 Bypass 10" to 12" Sewer Setup EA 1,500.00$                       3,050.00$                  
D 1.3 Bypass 15" to 18" Sewer Setup EA 2,000.00$                       3,100.00$                  
D 1.4 Bypass 24" Sewer Setup EA 3,500.00$                       3,150.00$                  
D 2.1 Bypass 4" Pump DAY 450.00$                          50.00$                       
D 2.2 Bypass 6" Pump DAY 450.00$                          400.00$                     
D 2.3 Bypass 8" Pump DAY 500.00$                          405.00$                     
D 2.4 Bypass 10" Pump DAY 600.00$                          405.00$                     

Total of C & D 14,183.00$                
Total of B & D 11,150.00$                     

Purchasing Agent: Jack Curran 
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