Project Mgr.: Kerry Runyon
Date Posted: 2-19-08
Date Due: 3-12-08

BID #08-5051
"Food for Concession Stand(s)"
Addendums: 0

Cheney Brothers,

Sysco Foodservice

Food Bid Information for NCRP [ Unit Inc. West Coast Florida | US Foodservice
Food Items |
Hamburgers 3 to 1 |b Holten IR $2.28 $34.48 No Bid
Hotdogs 6to 1lbor5to 1 Ib 6/1Ib or
Ball park, Sabrett, Nathans Hebrew National, Vienna 5/1lb $2.64 $76.24 No Bid
Chicken tenders GoldKist | 10Lbs $26.79 $30.24 No Bid
Chix Breast pre cooked Whole Muscle Breast Meat | 4oz $37.00 $41.71 No Bid
French Fries Shoestring | 6/51bs $15.72 $15.44 No Bid
Easy Macaroni Cheese Portion Control Bag | Kraft $30.98 $28.18 No Bid
Peanut Butter & Jelly Crustables | Smuckers $55.27 $33.81 No Bid
Bulk Pepperroni |  sb $2.36 $56.35 No Bid
Breakfast Items |
Muffins Assorted Otis Spunkmyer | 3oz No Bid $41.43 No Bid
Bacon, Egg & Cheese Sandwich | $14.64 $31.48 No Bid
Sausage, Egg, & Cheese Sandwich | $14.69 $31.56 No Bid
Bacon, Egg & Cheese Bagel | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sausage, Egg, & Cheese Bagel | No Bid $31.76 No Bid
Portion Control Cream Cheese | 1oz or 20z $16.09 $16.83 No Bid
TOTAL: $218.46 $469.51 $0.00
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Project Mgr.: Kerry Runyon
Date Posted: 2-19-08
Date Due: 3-12-08

BID #08-5051
"Food for Concession Stand(s)"
Addendums: 0

Cheney Brothers,

Sysco Foodservice

Food Bid Information for NCRP [ Unit Inc. West Coast Florida | US Foodservice
Paper Goods |
1Ib food tray | 1000 Cs $17.23 $22.69 No Bid
3lb food tray | 500Cs $18.56 $22.72 No Bid
16 oz cups/wax Must be wax | 1000 Cs $46.87 $33.82 No Bid
24 oz cups/wax Must be wax | 500Cs No Bid $54.15 No Bid
Plastic lids 160z | 1000 Cs $56.56 $45.03 No Bid
Plastic lids 240z | 1000 Cs $56.56 $91.57 No Bid
3.25 oz souffle cup | 2500 Cs $44.57 $52.96 No Bid
3.25 oz souffle lids | 2500 Cs $45.92 $53.89 No Bid
Forks | 1000 Cs $8.12 $12.09 No Bid
Spoons | 1000 Cs $8.23 $11.92 No Bid
Knives | 1000 Cs $8.23 $11.37 No Bid
Staws | 24/500 Cs $32.15 $44.43 No Bid
Aluminum Foil Wraps Reynolds | 121200 cs $120.19 $72.75 No Bid
Deli wrap (Plastic wrap) | 2000 ft $11.70 $14.92 No Bid
Pizza Boxes 50 or 100 count | 16inch $15.73 $13.04 No Bid
Nacho Tray Clear | 1000 Cs $121.31 $67.62 No Bid
Food Gloves (Latex) Large | 1000 Cs $39.60 $30.94 No Bid
Napkins Must fit in Easy Nap Dispensor | CASE $53.12 $52.25 No Bid
TOTAL: $704.65 $708.16 $0.00
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Project Mgr.: Kerry Runyon
Date Posted: 2-19-08
Date Due: 3-12-08

BID #08-5051
"Food for Concession Stand(s)"
Addendums: 0

Cheney Brothers,

Sysco Foodservice

Food Bid Information for NCRP [ Unit Inc. West Coast Florida | US Foodservice
Conidments |
Lettuce Shreds | 4/5b $15.75 $13.45 No Bid
Tomatoes | 251b bx $33.00 $28.18 No Bid
Mayo 9 grams | Partion control $9.56 $16.91 $9.93
Ketchup Hienz | Gallon Pump| $27.15 $27.72 $26.28
Mustard Hienz [ Gallon Pump| $20.15 $19.72 $18.72
Sour cream | 4/51b $20.15 $20.99 $21.67
Chili Sauce Must fit Gehls Gurnsey Farm dispensor | 800z No Bid $28.97 $29.13
Cheese sauce Chili Sauce Must fit Gehls Gumsey Farm dispensor | 80 0z No Bid $26.49 $26.63
Chedder Shreds [ 4/5b $3.05 $53.37 $58.33
American Cheese [ 4/55b $2.72 $54.36 $50.18
Chopped onions | 4/510 $20.00 $17.51 $18.51
BBQ Sauce 1oz | Partion control $12.67 $9.52 $11.23
Honey Mustard 2 o0z | Portion control $18.09 $18.59 $11.89
Ranch Dressing 2 0z | Portion control $17.62 $16.97 $11.89
Pickle Chips | 5gal $20.50 $21.51 $15.93
Relish 9 grams | Portion control $9.59 $21.71 $9.69
Salt | Portion control $4.83 $9.27 $5.50
Pepper | Partion control $8.59 $16.08 $5.50
Fry salt 25 Ib bag | Table salt $6.18 $3.70 $5.56
Fry oil [ 1/35 gal $26.88 $31.77 $31.42
TOTAL: $276.48 $456.79 $367.99
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Project Mgr.: Kerry Runyon
Date Posted: 2-19-08
Date Due: 3-12-08

BID #08-5051
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Cheney Brothers,

Sysco Foodservice

Food Bid Information for NCRP [ Unit Inc. West Coast Florida | US Foodservice
Chips |
Doritos FRITO LAY | 1.750z $24.57 $21.22 $21.33
Fritos FRITO LAY | 1.750z $22.87 $21.22 $21.38
BBQ FRITO LAY | 1.750z $22.73 $21.22 $21.33
Cheetos FRITO LAY | 1.750z $22.73 $21.22 $21.33
Ruffles FRITO LAY | 1.750z $22.73 $23.58 $21.33
Sour Cream & Onion FRITO LAY | 1.750z $17.67 $21.22 $21.33
Soft Pretzel King size | 50z $22.52 $22.49 $22.89
6/2 Ibs Bags or
Nacho chips/round equivalent $16.22 $12.32 $16.11
Peanuts & Cashews FRITO LAY or Planters | No shells No Bid $16.20 $16.40
Candy |
M&M Plain | 8/48 count $210.44 $190.94 $200.53
M&M Peanut | 8/48 count $210.44 $124.11 $200.53
Snickers | 8/48 count $210.44 $190.94 $200.53
Reese's [ 10/36 Count $203.78 No Bid No Bid
Kit Kat | CASE $201.89 No Bid No Bid
Twix Original | CASE $196.89 No Bid $131.20
Milkyway [10/36 Count $196.89 $179.01 No Bid
Skittles [ 10/36 Count $196.89 No Bid No Bid
Starburst [ 10/36 Count $196.89 No Bid No Bid
Cookies |
Chips Ahoy Mini's Only [ $21.17 $16.20 $16.56
Oreo Regular [ $20.48 $16.20 $16.30
Oreo Mini's [ $21.17 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL: $2,059.41 $898.09 $949.08
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Project Mgr.: Kerry Runyon
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BID #08-5051
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Cheney Brothers,

Sysco Foodservice

Food Bid Information for NCRP | Unit Inc. West Coast Florida | US Foodservice
Ice Cream |
King Cone Good Humor | $15.79 No Bid No Bid
Ice cream Sandwich Good Humor | $26.31 $13.04 No Bid
Oreo sandwich Klondike | $18.43 No Bid No Bid
Chocolate Chip Giant sandwich Good Humor | $14.77 $21.83 No Bid
Push ups Reckless Rainbow Popsicle | $8.79 $10.61 No Bid
Strawberry Shortcake Good Humor | $11.71 $18.03 No Bid
Ice cream Bar Good Humor | $11.63 $12.99 No Bid
Hyper Stripe Popsicle | No Bid No Bid No Bid
A & W Root Beer Popsicle | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bomb Pops, red, white & blue Popsicle | $21.27 $19.56 No Bid
7 0z Freeze pops Assorted flavors Jel Sert Flavor Ice | No Bid No Bid No Bid
3ordoz
Lemon ltalian Ice portion $13.20 $11.33 No Bid
4 or 4oz
Raspberry Italian Ice portion No Bid $11.33 No Bid
TOTAL: $141.90 $118.72 $0.00
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Project Mgr.: Kerry Runyon
Date Posted: 2-19-08
Date Due: 3-12-08

BID #08-5051
"Food for Concession Stand(s)"
Addendums: 0

Cheney Brothers,

Sysco Foodservice

Food Bid Information for NCRP [ Unit Inc. West Coast Florida | US Foodservice
Pizza & Bread |
Pizza |
Cheese Pizza Premade | 16inch $42.19 $60.50 $17.24
Bread Items |
Ham bun 4 inch Seedless [ $27.87 $19.62 $16.94
Hotdog bun 6in | $25.96 $22.78 $16.94
Bagels 4 inch Pre Sliced [ $22.02 $21.50 $18.57
TOTAL: $118.04 $124.40 $69.69
Prompt Payment Terms: __~ % _ Days;
Net 30 Days] Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
Addenda received (if applicable): N/A N/A N/A

Opening Agent: Scott D. Johnson

Witness: Courtney Grosman

This is a preliminary summary of the bids as they were opened and announced at the bid opening. Bid prices have not been verified and are subject to change in the event
mathematical errors are discovered during bid review. Other information contained in this summary is also subject to review.
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