Project Mgr.: Dr. Karen Brown
Date Posted: 10-30-07
Date Due: 11-14-07

Attachment "A"

BID #:08-5021

"Expendable Veterinary Supplies Equipment”

Addendums: 0
Attachment "A"

Notices Sent: 19
Packages Requested: 13
Bids Received: 4

Fort Dodge Animal Health

MWI Veterinary Supply

TW Medical Veterinary Supply

Webster Veterinary Supply, Inc.

Unit Price Unit Price | Unit Price Unit Price | Unit Price Unit Price | Unit Price Unit Price
Medications As Specified Substitutes As Specified JAs Specified| Substitutes As Specified JAs Specified| Substitutes As Specified JAs Specified| Substitutes As Specified
1|Acarexx 0.01% Otic Suspension 12/box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $91.73 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid N/A NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $73.38 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid
2|Acepromazine 10mg tablets 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.56 No Bid No Bid $14.98 No Bid No Bid $14.01 No Bid No Bid
3|Acepromazine 1mg tablets 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid See Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
4|Acepromazine 5mg tablets 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid See Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
5|Acepromazine Injectable 10 mg/ml 50ml No Bid Promace 1in j No Bid $8.59 No Bid No Bid $8.05 No Bid No Bid $9.95 No Bid No Bid
6| Acetylcysteine 20% Injectable 30ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29 No Bid No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid $12.37 No Bid No Bid
7|Albon oral suspension 5% 473 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Direct Only No Bid $46.08 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
8|Albon Tablets 125mg 200/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Direct Only No Bid $26.50 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
9|Albon Tablets 250mg 500/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Direct Only No Bid $102.88 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
10]Albon Tablets 500mg 500/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Direct Only No Bid $45.78 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
11]Atropine Sulfate Injectable 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.02 No Bid No Bid $2.08 No Bid No Bid $2.26 No Bid No Bid
12|Baytril Chewable Tablets 136mg 50/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A $133.49 No Bid No Bid
13|Baytril Tablets 136mg 200/bottle No Bid Dicuval - Dog Only $121.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $428.15 No Bid No Bid
14|Baytril Chewable Tablets 22.7mg 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $57.79 No Bid No Bid
15|Baytril Tablets 22.7mg 500/bottle No Bid Dicuval - Dog Only $351.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $231.53 No Bid No Bid
16|Baytril Chewable Tablets 68mg 50/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $74.32 No Bid No Bid
17|Baytril Tablets 68mg 250/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $297.69 No Bid No Bid
18|Baytril injectable 22.7% 20ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $28.68 No Bid No Bid
19|Baytril Otic Suspension 15ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $9.19 No Bid x12 = 110.28
20|Beuthanasia Injectable 100ml No Bid Sleepway $38.10 $38.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid Euthasol 100ml $32.85 $38.36 No Bid No Bid
21|Buprenorphine (0.3mg/ml) 10 vial/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.35 No Bid No Bid
22|Capstar 11.4 mg (Blue) 100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A 60ct = 95.00 No Bid
23|Capstar 57 mg mg (Green) 100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A 60ct = 110.00 No Bid
24|Cefa Tabs 100mg 500/bottle Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $129.25 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid
25|Cefa Tabs 200mg 250/bottle Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $126.00 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid
25|Cefa Tabs 50mg 500/bottle Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.55 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid
26| Cefa-drops 50 mg/ml 15ml $9.90 No Bid No Bid $12.99 No Bid No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $13.46 No Bid No Bid
27|Cefa-drops 50 mg/ml 50ml $16.79 No Bid No Bid $21.40 No Bid No Bid $19.95 No Bid No Bid $22.18 No Bid No Bid
28| Cefazolin for injection 1 gram No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.29 No Bid No Bid $1.15 No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid
29|Centrine Injectable 0.50 mg/ml 10ml $32.51 No Bid No Bid $40.95 No Bid No Bid $45.12 No Bid No Bid $42.45 No Bid No Bid
30| Cephalexin 250mg capsules 500/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.88 No Bid No Bid $31.50 No Bid No Bid $34.00 No Bid No Bid
31|Cephalexin 500mg capsules 500/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.13 No Bid No Bid $49.87 No Bid No Bid $59.95 No Bid No Bid
32|Chlorpheniramine 4mg tablets 1000/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.71 No Bid No Bid $3.25 No Bid No Bid $3.18 No Bid No Bid
33|Clavamox 125mg 210 tabs/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.35 No Bid No Bid $111.15 No Bid No Bid $100.35 No Bid No Bid
34|Clavamox 250mg 210 tabs/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $164.60 No Bid No Bid $182.55 No Bid No Bid $164.60 No Bid No Bid
35|Clavamox 375mg 210 tabs/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $238.80 No Bid No Bid $265.32 No Bid No Bid $238.80 No Bid No Bid
36|Clavamox 62.5mg 210 tabs/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.15 No Bid No Bid $60.15 No Bid No Bid $54.15 No Bid No Bid
37|Clavamox drops 15ml 12 bottles/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 No Bid No Bid $8.32 No Bid No Bid $90.00 No Bid No Bid
38| Clindamycin capsules 25mg 600/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid $103.58 No Bid No Bid $110.50 No Bid No Bid
39]|Clindamycin capsules 75mg 200/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $92.94 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $103.00 No Bid No Bid
40[Clindamycin capsules 150mg 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.59 No Bid No Bid $9.03 No Bid No Bid $10.35 No Bid No Bid
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Medications As Specified Substitutes As Specified | As Specified Substitutes As Specified | As Specified Substitutes As Specified | As Specified Substitutes As Specified
41|Clindamycin drops 25 mg/ml 20ml bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.94 No Bid No Bid $3.05 No Bid No Bid $3.35 No Bid No Bid
42|Depo Medrol ~ 20mg/ml 10ml bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
43|Depo Medrol 20 mg/ml 20ml bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.26 No Bid No Bid $35.52 No Bid No Bid $31.26 No Bid No Bid
44|Deramaxx Chewable tablets 25mg 90/bottle No Bid Etogesic 150mg/0ct 25lb $55.39 No Bid Agency No Bid $70.00 No Bid No Bid $62.50 No Bid No Bid
45|Deramaxx Chewable tablets 50mg 90/bottle No Bid Etogesic 300mg/0ct 50lb $67.59 No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
46|Deramaxx Chewable tablets 100mg 90/bottle No Bid Etogesic Same $67.59 No Bid Agency No Bid $137.00 No Bid No Bid $134.00 No Bid No Bid
47|Dexamethasone Injectable 2 mg/ml 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.24 No Bid No Bid $3.66 SP 11/8/07 No Bid $3.10 No Bid No Bid
48| Dexamethasone Sodium Phos. 4 mg/ml 30ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.71 No Bid No Bid $5.99 No Bid No Bid $10.50 No Bid No Bid
49| Dextrose 50% 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.76 No Bid No Bid $0.80 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
50|Diarsanyl Oral Paste 10 ml tube No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.50 No Bid No Bid $5.45 No Bid No Bid
51|Diarsanyl Oral Paste 24 ml tube No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.48 No Bid No Bid $6.25 No Bid No Bid
52| Diazepam Injectable 5 mg/ml 10m| No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.81 No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid $1.32 No Bid No Bid
53| Diazepam Injectable 5 mg/ml 10ml 5 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.82 No Bid No Bid $6.25 No Bid No Bid $6.60 No Bid No Bid
54| Diphenhydramine capsules 25mg 1000/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.12 No Bid No Bid $13.56 No Bid No Bid $11.50 No Bid No Bid
55| Diphenhydramine capsules 50mg 1000/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.24 No Bid No Bid $14.05 No Bid No Bid $12.85 No Bid No Bid
56 | Diphenhydramine HCL Injectable 50 mg/ml 10ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.75 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
57|Dopram V Injectable 20ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.95 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $53.33 Respiram No Bid
58| Doxycycline capsules 100mg 500/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.81 No Bid No Bid $22.67 No Bid No Bid $23.50 No Bid No Bid
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59| Doxycycline capsules 50mg 500/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.53 No Bid No Bid $35.77 No Bid No Bid $37.30 No Bid No Bid
60| Doxycycline oral syrup 10mg/ml 50ml/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
61|Doxycycline Injectable 100 ml vials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.63 No Bid No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid
62| Doxycycline tablets 100mg 500/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.92 No Bid No Bid $23.35 No Bid No Bid $24.25 No Bid No Bid
63| Doxycycline tablets 50mg 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
64| Droncit Injectable 56.8mg/ml 50ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid No Bid Cestaject $284.95 $244.96 Cestaject No Bid
65| Droncit tablets 23mg 150/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A $340.08 No Bid No Bid
66| Droncit tablets 34mg 150/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A $305.13 Cest Tabs No Bid
67| Drontal Plus 136 mg tablets (large) 30/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A $345.40 No Bid No Bid
68| Drontal Plus 22.7mg tablets (sm-med) 50/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A $121.85 No Bid No Bid
69| Drontal Plus 68mg tablets (med-lg) 50/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A $316.99 No Bid No Bid
70| Drontal tablets for Cats/kittens 50 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid N/A N/A N/A $118.99 No Bid No Bid
71|Epinephrine HCL __ 1:1000 30ml No Bid | NO SUBSTITUTE | No Bid $4.98 NO SUBSTITUTE | No Bid $2.30 NO SUBSTITUTE | No Bid $2.55 NO SUBSTITUTE | No Bid
72|Flunixin Meglumine 50 mg/ml 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.98 No Bid No Bid $12.71 No Bid No Bid
73|Famotidine injectable (40mg/4ml) 10 x 4ml vial No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid No Bid No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid
74|Famotidine injectable (20mg/2ml) 20 ml vial No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid $8.56 No Bid No Bid $10.65 No Bid No Bid
75| Gentamicin Injectable 100 mg/ml 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.95 SP 11/8 No Bid $12.50 No Bid No Bid
76| Gentamicin Ophthalmic Solution 5ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.24 No Bid No Bid $1.28 No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid
78 |Gentamicin, Sulfate, Bentamethasone Valerate, USP, Clotrimazole 7.5 g tube No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Genone Otic 7.5ml $2.99 $3.20 No Bid No Bid $2.25 Vetro Max No Bid
79 |Gentamicin, Sulfate, Bentamethasone Valerate, USP, Clotrimazole  15g tube No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Genone Otic 15ml $4.68 $4.99 No Bid No Bid $3.47 Vetro Max No Bid
80|Gentamicin Sulfate w/Betamethasone Spray 120ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | cenone Topical Spray 120cc $8.02 $8.58 No Bid No Bid $8.55 Betagen Spray No Bid
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Medications As Specified Substitutes As Specified | As Specified Substitutes As Specified | As Specified Substitutes As Specified | As Specified Substitutes As Specified
81 |Goodwinol Ointment 1 pound No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.23 100z Godurio 1 No Bid $5.48 No Bid No Bid $18.75 No Bid No Bid
82 |Heparin 1000 units/ml 10ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $1.80 No Bid No Bid
83 |[Heparin 1000 units/ml 30ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.46 No Bid No Bid $2.44 No Bid No Bid $4.30 No Bid No Bid
84 |Hydrocodone tablets 100mg 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.56 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
85 |Hydrocodone tablets 500mg 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.41 5/500mg No Bid $4.95 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
86 |Hydromet Syrup 16 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.99 SP 11/9 No Bid $21.90 No Bid No Bid
87 |Ivermectin Injection 1% sterile solution 50 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Vetrimec 1% inj 50cc $22.36 N/A N/A N/A $22.80 Ivercide No Bid
88 |Ivermectin Injection 1% sterile solution 100 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Vetrimec 1% inj 100cc $31.10 $72.50 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
89 |Hydroxyzine HCL tablets 25mg 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.12 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid $9.06 No Bid No Bid
90 |Kaolin Pectin Suspension gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Kaopec AL $4.66 $8.95 No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid No Bid
91 |Ketamine Injectable 100 mg/ml 10ml bottle No Bid Ketaset $4.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid $5.60 Ketaject No Bid
92 |Lactated Ringers Solution 1000mlI bags case No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.98 No Bid No Bid $24.00 No Bid No Bid $19.35 Abbott No Bid
93 |Laxatone 4 1/4 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.69 No Bid No Bid $4.25 No Bid No Bid $3.80 No Bid No Bid
94 |Lidocaine Injectable 2% 100ml| No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.22 No Bid No Bid See Bid No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid No Bid
95 [Liguamycin LA-200 (Oxytetracycline) Injectable 200mg/ml 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.94 No Bid No Bid $7.23 No Bid No Bid $7.95 Maxim 20 No Bid
96 |Lixotinic gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.69 No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid $51.69 Pfizer No Bid
97 |LymDyp gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid $61.43 No Bid No Bid $58.36 No Bid No Bid $58.36 DVM No Bid
98 [Metacam (meloxicam) 1.5 mg/ml Oral Suspension 32ml bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.68 No Bid No Bid $19.20 No Bid No Bid $19.20 No Bid No Bid
99 [Metacam (meloxicam) 1.5 mg/ml Oral Suspension 100ml bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.95 No Bid No Bid $45.95 No Bid No Bid $46.95 No Bid No Bid
100 |Metacam for injection (5mg/ml) 10ml bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.35 No Bid No Bid $59.95 No Bid No Bid $59.95 No Bid No Bid
101 [Metoclopramide Injectable 5mg/ml 30ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.35 No Bid No Bid $5.99 No Bid No Bid $7.92 No Bid No Bid
102 [Metronidazole Tablets 250mg 500/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.81 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid
103 [Miconazole Spray 120ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.95 No Bid No Bid $6.58 No Bid No Bid $6.75 No Bid No Bid
104 [Mitaban Dip 10.6ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid $19.98 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
105 [Neo Predef w/Tetracaine powder 15 gram dozen No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.38 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
106 [Neomycin/Polymyxin/Bacitracin Ophthalmic ointment 1/8 0z No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.53 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid No Bid $2.30 Vetropolycin No Bid
107 [Neomycin/Polymyxin/Bacitracin w/Hydrocortis. Opth. Oint . 1/8 0z No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.17 No Bid No Bid $2.50 No Bid No Bid $2.75 Vetropolycin HC No Bid
108 |Nitrofurazone Qintment 1 pound No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.05 No Bid No Bid $6.76 No Bid No Bid $5.72 No Bid No Bid
109 |Nutrical 4 1/4 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.71 No Bid No Bid $4.05 No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid No Bid
110 |Orbax Caplets 22.7mg 250/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $188.69 No Bid No Bid $216.00 No Bid No Bid $188.69 No Bid No Bid
111 |Orbax Caplets 68mg 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $189.12 No Bid No Bid $215.00 No Bid No Bid $189.12 No Bid No Bid
112 [Orbax Caplets 5.7mg 250/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.00 No Bid No Bid $96.98 No Bid No Bid
113 [Oxytocin Injectable 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.85 No Bid No Bid $3.00 No Bid No Bid
114 [Panacur powder 1 pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.95 No Bid No Bid $179.43 No Bid No Bid
115 [Panacur suspension 1000m| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.00 SP 11/9 No Bid $90.71 No Bid No Bid
116 [Paramite Dip 4 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
117 |Penicillin G Procaine & Benzathine 300,000 units/ml 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.92 No Bid No Bid $7.85 No Bid No Bid
118 |Penicillin G Procaine 300,000 units/ml 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.42 No Bid No Bid $7.50 No Bid No Bid
119 [Pet Tinic 40z No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.18 No Bid No Bid $5.20 Liqui Tinic No Bid
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120 [Poly flex 10g Long Term BO Polyflex 25g $30.17 Backordered No Bid No Bid $35.45 No Bid No Bid $21.44 No Bid No Bid
121 [PRN Wound Dressing 20 ounce tub No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.87 No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $11.55 No Bid No Bid
122 [Proparacaine Ophthalmic 5ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid APX 15ml $4.35 $3.75 No Bid No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid
123 [Relief Spray 8 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.67 No Bid No Bid $5.67 No Bid No Bid $5.67 No Bid No Bid
124 [Rimadyl Caplets 100mg 100/bottle No Bid | Etogesic 300mg 190ct |  $67.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.16 No Bid No Bid $134.20 No Bid No Bid
125 [Rimadyl Caplets 25mg 60/bottle No Bid Etogesic 150mg 90ct $55.39 $31.00 No Bid No Bid $31.48 No Bid No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid
126 [Rimadyl Caplets 75mg 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid $115.32 No Bid No Bid $113.55 No Bid No Bid
127 [Rimadyl Chewable Tablets 100mg 180/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid $134.55 No Bid No Bid $130.75 No Bid No Bid
128 [Rimadyl Chewable Tablets 25mg 60/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid $29.42 No Bid No Bid $28.95 No Bid No Bid
129 [Rimadyl Chewable Tablets 75mg 180/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid $108.65 No Bid No Bid $106.80 No Bid No Bid
130 [Rimady! Sterile Injectable Solution 50mg/ml 20ml bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid $69.88 No Bid No Bid $68.15 No Bid No Bid
131 [Robinul V Injectable 20ml Discontinued No Bid No Bid $22.07 No Bid No Bid $5.98 No Bid No Bid $5.65 No Bid No Bid
132 |Sodium Chloride 0.9% 1000ml bag case No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.71 No Bid No Bid $24.00 No Bid No Bid $25.98 No Bid No Bid
133 |Soludelta Cortef Injectable 500mg 10ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.57 No Bid No Bid $29.93 No Bid No Bid $26.57 No Bid No Bid
134 |Solu-Medrol Injectable 500mg 4ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.28  |Sterile Lube 1oz Priority Care $0.73 $11.45 No Bid No Bid $12.20 No Bid No Bid
135 [ Sterile Ophthalmic Lubricating Ointment 1/8 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 No Bid No Bid $1.81 See Bid No Bid
136 | Sulfamethoxazole & Trimethoprim Oral Suspension 473ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | sustain i calf Bolus 8.026m $34.75 $14.62 No Bid No Bid $12.75 No Bid No Bid
137 [Telazol Injectable Powder 100 mg/ml 5ml $30.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.11 No Bid $35.99 No Bid No Bid $36.93 No Bid No Bid
138 [Termaril-P Tablets 100/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid $32.50 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid
139 [ Terramycin Ophthalmic Ointment 1/8 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.97 No Bid No Bid $8.20 No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid
140 [Torbugesic Injectable 10 mg/ml 50ml $130.00 No Bid No Bid $185.95 No Bid No Bid $158.00 No Bid No Bid $145.88 Dolorex No Bid
141 [Torbutrol 10mg tabs 100/bottle $199.90 No Bid No Bid $250.85 No Bid No Bid $254.06 No Bid No Bid $236.91 No Bid No Bid
142 [Torbutrol 1mg tabs 100/bottle $52.79 No Bid No Bid $66.69 No Bid No Bid $69.40 No Bid No Bid $62.99 No Bid No Bid
143 [Torbutrol 5mg tabs 100/bottle $121.87 No Bid No Bid $152.95 No Bid No Bid $132.64 No Bid No Bid $144.46 No Bid No Bid
144 Toxi Ban granules 1 pound No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.33 No Bid No Bid $19.04 No Bid No Bid $22.66 No Bid No Bid
145 [Toxi Ban Suspension 240ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.02 No Bid No Bid $8.82 No Bid No Bid $9.60 No Bid No Bid
146 | Tresaderm 15.0ml 12/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.29 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
147 | Tresaderm _7.5ml 12/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.02 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
148 | VAL Syrup 80z bottle $17.25 No Bid No Bid $16.65 No Bid No Bid $15.30 SP 11/9 No Bid $17.25 No Bid No Bid
149 [VAL Syrup gallon $125.70 No Bid NoBid [ $121.26 No Bid No Bid | $128.00 No Bid No Bid [ $125.70 No Bid No Bid
150 |vitamin B Complex Injectable 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.64 No Bid No Bid $2.31 No Bid No Bid $1.95 No Bid No Bid
151 |Vvitamin B 12 Injection 100ml/bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.71 No Bid No Bid $3.24 No Bid No Bid $3.05 1000mcg No Bid
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Medications As Specified ubstitute: As Specified | As Specified ubstitute: As Specified | As Specified ubstitute: As Specified | As Specified ubstitute: As Specified

152 Vitamin K Injectable 100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.22 No Bid No Bid $9.12 No Bid No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid
153 | Xylazine Injectable 100 mg/ml 50ml No Bid Sedazine $22.98 No Bid | Anased LA100 50cc $15.01 $17.26 No Bid No Bid $17.45 No Bid No Bid
154|zn7 Neutralized Zinc Spray 2 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.49 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A $8.49 No Bid No Bid

Opening Agent: Scott D. Johnson

Witness: Courtney Grosman

This is a preliminary summary of the bids as they were opened and announced at the bid opening. Bid prices have not been verified and are subject to change in the event mathematical errors are discovered during bid review. Other information
contained in this summary is also subject to review.

Page 3 of 3




