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BID #08-5021
"Expendable Veterinary Supplies Equipment"

Addendums: 0
Attachment "B"

Notices Sent: 19
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Bids Received: 4

Attachment "B"
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
1 Abbott Venoset 78" Microdrip IV set with cair clamp, pre-pierced y-site, vented (15 drops/ml)                     each No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid
2 Abbott Venoset 72" Microdrip IV set with cair clamp, pre-pierced y-site, vented (15 drops/ml)                     each No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.95 No Bid No Bid
3 Abbott Venoset 72" Microdrip IV set with cair clamp, pre-pierced y-site, vented (30 drops/ml)                     each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Advantage 10 Dog green                                                                                                                      6 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $468.12 No Bid No Bid
5 Advantage for cats 18 purple                                                                                                                6 pack No Bid See Bid No Bid Agency No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $471.84 No Bid No Bid
6 Advantage for cats 9 orange                                                                                                                 6 pack No Bid See Bid No Bid Agency No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $471.84 No Bid No Bid
7 Alcohol, 70% Isopropyl                                                                                                                         quart No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.38 No Bid No Bid See Bid No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
8 Alcohol, 70% Isopropyl                                                                                                                        gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 Anesthesia F/Air canister gas filters                                                                                                      each No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.19 No Bid No Bid $5.18 No Bid No Bid $5.20 No Bid No Bid

10 Applicators, Cotton Tipped                                                                                                                  500/pack No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.13 No Bid No Bid $3.99 No Bid No Bid $3.53 No Bid No Bid
11 Applicators, Tongue Depressors                                                                                                          500/pack No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.72 No Bid No Bid $4.02 No Bid No Bid $3.06 No Bid No Bid
12 Aquaject Sterile Water                                                                                                                            250ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.82 No Bid No Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid $2.65 No Bid No Bid
13 Autoclave Chamber Brite Tuttnauer Cleaner                                                                                               box No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.35 No Bid No Bid $36.00 No Bid No Bid $39.99 No Bid No Bid
14 Autoclave Sterilization Indicator strips                                                                                                        box No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.21 No Bid No Bid $10.95 No Bid No Bid $16.40 No Bid No Bid
15 Autoclave Tape     3/4 inch                                                                                                                   each No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00 No Bid No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid $3.18 No Bid No Bid
16 Cohesive Flexible Bandage Self adherent stretched  Assorted Colors    (Pet Flex)   4" x 5 yds                  18/box       No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.15 No Bid No Bid $28.05 No Bid No Bid $17.55 Web Tear No Bid
17 Cohesive Flexible Bandage Self adherent stretched Assorted Colors      (Pet Flex)  3" x 5 yds                  24/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.60 No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid No Bid $28.50 Pet Flex No Bid
18 Cohesive Flexible Bandage Self adherent stretched Assorted colors (Pet Flex) 2" x 5 yds                        24/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.64 No Bid No Bid $38.58 No Bid No Bid $28.35 Web Tear No Bid
19 Bandage, Equiflex 2" x 5yds color pack                                                                                               36/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Bandage, Equiflex 4" x 5yds color pack                                                                                               36/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 Benz-All 40 ml Benz-All Laboratories                                                                                                   15/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.47 No Bid No Bid $1.55 No Bid No Bid $25.35 No Bid No Bid
22 Bio-Dress Absorbant Wound Dressing Synthetic                                                                                      box No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid $12.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 Blades, Miltex Stainless Steel Surgical size 10                                                                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.76 No Bid No Bid $26.00 TW-SBSS-10 $12.00 $21.40 No Bid No Bid
24 Blades, Miltex Stainless Steel Surgical size 11                                                                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.76 No Bid No Bid $26.00 TW-SBSS-11 $12.00 $21.40 No Bid No Bid
25 Blades, Miltex Stainless Steel Surgical size 12                                                                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.80 No Bid No Bid $32.50 No Bid No Bid $21.40 No Bid No Bid
26 Blades, Miltex Stainless Steel Surgical size 15                                                                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.76 No Bid No Bid $26.00 TW-SBSS-15 $12.00 $21.40 No Bid No Bid
27 Blades, Stainless Steel Surgical (scrapes) sz 10                                                                                   100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid $15.50 No Bid No Bid
28 Bronchi-Shield III                                                                                                                                 25 tray 40 No Bid 40 $79.09 No Bid No Bid $75.65 No Bid No Bid $79.75 No Bid No Bid
29 Brush, Cub Scrub-Open end, channel -back, block with pure nylon bristles                                              each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BId No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid
30 Brush, Endotrachael 4mm                                                                                                                   each No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.35 No Bid No Bid $4.70 No Bid No Bid $3.16 No Bid No Bid
31 Brush, Instrument MX3-1000 Nylon Bristle                                                                                             each No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.20 No Bid No Bid $8.32 No Bid No Bid $3.75 No Bid No Bid
32 Cap, Injection                                                                                                                                    100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid $38.95 No Bid No Bid $41.00 No Bid No Bid
33 Cap, Surgeons                                                                                                                                   box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid $9.30 No Bid No Bid
34 Cast Padding, Specialist Johnson & Johnson 2"                                                                                     pack No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $14.65 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $22.75 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified

35 Cast Padding, Specialist Johnson & Johnson 3"                                                                                    pack No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $9.00 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $16.22 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid
36 Cast Padding, Specialist Johnson & Johnson 4"                                                                                    pack No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $11.25 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $22.29 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid
37 Cotton Tubular Stockinete  2"                                                                                                               box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.41 No Bid No Bid $8.35 No Bid No Bid $4.75 No Bid No Bid
38 Cotton Tubular Stockinete  3"                                                                                                               box No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.06 No Bid No Bid $15.32 No Bid No Bid $5.95 No Bid No Bid
39 Cotton Tubular Stockinete  4"                                                                                                               box No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.31 No Bid No Bid $14.32 No Bid No Bid $7.75 No Bid No Bid
40 Casting Material, Delta Lites 2" x 4yds                                                                                                  box No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.84 No Bid No Bid $7.10 No Bid No Bid $115.00 No Bid No Bid
41 Casting Material, Delta Lites 3" x 4yds                                                                                                  box No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.39 No Bid No Bid $9.28 No Bid No Bid $140.00 No Bid No Bid
42 Casting Material, Delte Lites 4" x 4yds                                                                                                  box No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $189.00 No Bid No Bid
43 Cat Sacks, set of 3                                                                                                                              set No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid See Bid No Bid $52.05 No Bid No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid
44 Catheter, Sovereign Urethral 3 1/2 french x 16"                                                                                      each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.88 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid No Bid $0.95 No Bid No Bid
45 Catheter, Sovereign Urethral 5 french x 16"                                                                                           each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.88 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid No Bid $0.95 No Bid No Bid
46 Catheter, Terumo IV 18 gauge                                                                                                             50/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.85 No Bid No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid
47 Catheter, Terumo IV 20 gauge x 1 1/4"                                                                                                 50/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.73 No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid
48 Catheter, Terumo IV 22 gauge x1"                                                                                                        50/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.85 No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid
49 Catheter, Terumo IV  24 gauge x 3/4"                                                                                                   50/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.85 No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid
50 Catheter, BD IV 24 gauge x 3/4"                                                                                                          50/box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $0.82 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $31.00 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $45.00 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
51 Catheter, Abbott IV 24 gauge x 3/4"                                                                                                     50/box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $1.98 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $115.00 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $94.00 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
52 Catheter, Tomcat 4 1/2 open x/adp shw                                                                                                each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.69 No Bid No Bid $0.75 No Bid No Bid $0.75 No Bid No Bid
53 Chlorhexiderm Scrub 4%                                                                                                                    gallon No Bid Nolvasan Surgical Scrub 51.62 No Bid $25.52 No Bid No Bid $45.00 SP 11/9 No Bid $25.66 First Priority No Bid
54 Circuit Pediatric Universal  "F" without 1-liter bag                                                                                   each No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.76 No Bid No Bid $13.00 SP 11/9 No Bid $12.50 No Bid No Bid
55 Circuit Pediatric Universal  "F" with 1-liter bag                                                                                       each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.05 No Bid No Bid $17.50 No Bid No Bid
56 Circuit Universal "F"    with 2-liter bag                                                                                                   each No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.63 No Bid No Bid $19.05 No Bid No Bid $18.75 No Bid No Bid
57 Circuit Universal "F"    without 2-liter bag                                                                                              each No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.47 No Bid No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $17.50 No Bid No Bid
58 Collars, Buster  Clip Collar 7.5cm                                                                                                        each No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.82 No Bid No Bid $2.15 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid No Bid
59 Collars, Buster  Clip Collar 12.5cm                                                                                                      each No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.24 Eliz VTI Vetview $2.12 No Bid SP 11/9 No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid
60 Collars, Buster  Clip Collar 15cm                                                                                                         each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Eliz VTI Vetview $2.75 $3.05 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid No Bid
61 Collars, Buster  Clip Collar 20cm                                                                                                         each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Eliz VTI Vetview $2.96 $3.28 No Bid No Bid $2.25 No Bid No Bid
62 Collars, Buster  Clip Collar 10cm                                                                                                         each No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.16 Eliz VTI Vetview $1.99 $2.10 No Bid No Bid $1.15 No Bid No Bid
63 Collars, Buster  Clip Collar 25cm                                                                                                         each No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $4.15 No Bid No Bid $2.56 No Bid No Bid
64 Collars, Buster  Clip Collar 30cm                                                                                                         each No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.47 No Bid No Bid $4.50 No Bid No Bid $3.38 No Bid No Bid
65 Collars, Buster Clip Collar 40cm                                                                                                          each No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.94 No Bid No Bid $8.35 No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid
66 Cotton Balls                                                                                                                                    2,000 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.32 No Bid No Bid $5.99 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid
67 Rapid Vet-D                                                                                                                                      25 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.00 No Bid No Bid
68 Dermatophyte Test Med. (DTM)                                                                                                          20/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.88 No Bid No Bid $11.35 No Bid No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid
69 Diaphragm, Replacement X-Large for Canine Clear Plastic Mask                                                            each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.65 No Bid No Bid
70 Diaphragm, Replacement Large for Canine Clear Plastic Mask                                                               each No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.08 Matrix No Bid $20.59 11/9 SP No Bid $21.65 No Bid No Bid
71 Diaphragm, Replacement Small for Canine Clear Plastic Mask                                                               each No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.21 Matrix No Bid $20.59 No Bid No Bid $21.65 No Bid No Bid
72 Diaphragm, Replacement Large for Feline Clear Plastic Mask                                                                 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.48 Matrix No Bid $18.80 No Bid No Bid $19.75 No Bid No Bid
73 Diaphragm, Replacement Medium for Feline Clear Plastic Mask                                                              each No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.85 Matrix No Bid $18.80 No Bid No Bid $19.75 No Bid No Bid
74 Diaphragm, Replacement Small for Feline Clear Plastic Mask                                                                 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.68 Matrix No Bid $18.80 No Bid No Bid $19.75 No Bid No Bid
75 Drain, Penrose 1/2" x 12"                                                                                                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.48 No Bid No Bid $0.55 No Bid No Bid $0.55 No Bid No Bid
76 Drain, Penrose 1/4" x 12"                                                                                                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.48 No Bid No Bid $0.62 No Bid No Bid $0.55 No Bid No Bid
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Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified

77 Dropper Bottles, amber glass with bakelite screw top attached to medicine dropper  1/2 oz.                     12/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.72 No Bid No Bid $27.08 No Bid No Bid $15.85 No Bid No Bid
78 Dropper Bottles, amber glass with bakelite screw top attached to medicine dropper  1oz.                         12/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.86 No Bid No Bid $29.54 No Bid No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid
79 Dual Quat, Vet Solutions 16%                                                                                                             gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.89 No Bid No Bid
80 Duramune Max 5-Cvk (DA2PPCVK)                                                                                                    25/tray $78.75 No Bid $78.75 $131.82 No Bid No Bid $120.88 No Bid No Bid $132.75 No Bid No Bid
81 Duramune Max 5-Cvk/4L (DA2PPLCVK)                                                                                              25/tray $87.50 No Bid No Bid $105.76 No Bid No Bid $146.92 No Bid No Bid $154.75 No Bid No Bid
82 Ear Cleansing Solution, Oti Rinse                                                                                                        gallon No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $34.50 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $37.33 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid
83 Electric Tattoo Kit                                                                                                                               each No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid $480.00 No Bid No Bid $334.00 No Bid No Bid
84 Esbilac liquid                                                                                                                                   8 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.79 No Bid No Bid $1.80 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid
85 Esbilac powder                                                                                                                               12 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.61 No Bid No Bid $9.85 No Bid No Bid $9.85 No Bid No Bid
86 Eye Wash, Sterile                                                                                                                            4 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.39 No Bid No Bid $1.44 No Bid No Bid $1.35 No Bid No Bid
87 EZ Scrub Brush with 4% Chlorhexiderm Gluconate                                                                             30/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.20 No Bid No Bid $18.75 No Bid No Bid $27.50 No Bid No Bid
88 Fecal Flotation Solution (pre-mixed)                                                                                                   gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.51 No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $6.65 No Bid No Bid
89 Fecal Loop Adult                                                                                                                               each No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.59 No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid $1.68 No Bid No Bid
90 Fecal Loop Puppy                                                                                                                             each No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.59 No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid $1.68 No Bid No Bid
91 Fel-O-Guard 3 Plus (MLV vaccine)                                                                                                     50/tray $31.25 No Bid No Bid $69.70 No Bid No Bid $48.66 No Bid No Bid $70.00 No Bid No Bid
92 Fel-O-Vax Lv-K (killed FELV)                                                                                                             50/tray $222.50 No Bid No Bid $382.12 No Bid No Bid $355.56 No Bid No Bid $384.50 No Bid No Bid
93 Frontline Plus for Cats & Kittens 6 pack                                                                                           10/carton No Bid ProMen's for Cats No Bid $49.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 Frontline Plus for Dogs & Puppies 11-22 6 pk                                                                                   10/carton No Bid ProMen's for Dogs See Bid $50.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
95 Frontline Plus for Dogs & Puppies 23-44 6pk                                                                                    10/carton No Bid ProMen's for Dogs See Bid $52.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96 Frontline Plus for Dogs & Puppies 45-88 6pk                                                                                    10/carton No Bid ProMen's for Dogs See Bid $54.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
97 Frontline Plus for Dogs & Puppies 89-132 6pk                                                                                  10/carton No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
98 Frontline Spray 500ml bottles                                                                                                           6/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
99 Gauze, 3x3         Versalon                                                                                                             200 pack No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $1.65 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $3.00 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $2.95 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
100 Gauze, 4x4          Versalon                                                                                                            200 pack No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $3.68 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $5.15 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $5.05 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
101 Gauze, Kling Band 2"                                                                                                                        pack No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid Conform 2" $3.58 $1.08 WVS Conform No Bid
102 Gauze, Kling Band 3"                                                                                                                        pack No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid Conform 3" $4.58 $1.40 WVS Conform No Bid
103 Gloves, Exam Latex Free, No Powder Size Large                                                                              100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.59 No Bid No Bid $4.50 No Bid No Bid $6.56 WVS Conform No Bid
104 Gloves, Exam Latex No Powder Size Extra-Large                                                                              100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.49 No Bid No Bid $8.50 No Bid No Bid $6.56 ALI Nitrile No Bid
105 Gloves, Exam Latex Size Extra-Large                                                                                               100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.37 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $4.95 ALI Nitrile No Bid
106 Gloves, Exam Latex Size Large                                                                                                        100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.37 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $4.95 No Bid No Bid
107 Gloves, Exam Latex Size Medium                                                                                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.37 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $4.95 No Bid No Bid
108 Gloves, Exam Latex Size Small                                                                                                        100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.37 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $4.95 No Bid No Bid
109 Gloves, Surgical Sterile Ansell Perry Original Style 42 Size 7                                                              100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.92 No Bid No Bid $84.00 No Bid No Bid $19.00 No Bid No Bid
110 Gloves, Surgical Sterile Ansell Perry Original Style 42 Size 8                                                              100/box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTIES No Bid $19.92 NO SUBSTITUTIES No Bid $84.00 NO SUBSTITUTIES No Bid $19.00 NO SUBSTITUTIES No Bid
111 Gloves, Surgical Sterile Ansell Perry Original Style 42 Size 6                                                              100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.92 No Bid No Bid $84.00 No Bid No Bid $19.00 No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified

112 Granules, Sodasorb CO2 absorbant                                                                                                    5 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.06 No Bid No Bid $99.78 No Bid No Bid $70.00 No Bid No Bid
113 IDEXX Cite FELV/FIV Combo Snap test                                                                                               30/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $495.00 No Bid No Bid $545.44 No Bid No Bid $371.25 Idexx Humane Pricing No Bid
114 IDEXX Cite Heartworm Snap test                                                                                                         30/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $201.00 No Bid No Bid $193.22 No Bid No Bid $150.75 Idexx Humane Pricing No Bid
115 IDEXX Cite Parvo Snap tests                                                                                                                5/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid $71.00 No Bid No Bid $52.00 Idexx Humane Pricing No Bid
116 Isoflurane Anesthesia                                                                                                                         100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.95 VTI Isofluvane $10.00 $10.75 No Bid No Bid $9.10 No Bid No Bid
117 Isoflurane Anesthesia                                                                                                                         250ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid VTI Isofluvane $21.76 $22.60 No Bid No Bid $21.25 No Bid No Bid
118 Jars, (glass) Sundry                                                                                                                            set/5 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.59 No Bid No Bid $3.80 Total $19.00 No Bid $33.90 No Bid No Bid
119 KMR liquid                                                                                                                                        8 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.07 No Bid No Bid $2.21 SP 11/9 No Bid $1.98 No Bid No Bid
120 KMR powder                                                                                                                                    12 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.40 No Bid No Bid $10.76 No Bid No Bid $10.65 No Bid No Bid
121 Kwip Stop                                                                                                                                        14gram No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.64 No Bid No Bid $3.69 No Bid No Bid $3.75 No Bid No Bid
122 Lint Roller                                                                                                                                         dozen No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.07 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid $26.16 No Bid No Bid
123 Lint Roller Refills                                                                                                                               dozen No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid $22.00 No Bid No Bid $23.76 No Bid No Bid
124 Mask, Anes. Canine xlarge clear lexan cone w/flex. rubber diaphragm                                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Spec Order No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid
125 Mask, Anes. Canine large clear lexan cone w/flex. rubber diaphragm                                                      each No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.34 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid $25.75 No Bid No Bid
126 Mask, Anes. Canine sm clear lexan cone w/flex. rubber diaphragm                                                        each No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.67 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid $25.75 No Bid No Bid
127 Mask, Anes. Feline lg clear lexan cone w/flex. rubber diaphragm                                                            each No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.56 Bickford No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $36.65 No Bid No Bid
128 Mask, Anes. Feline med clear lexan cone w/flex. rubber diaphragm                                                        each No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.69 Bickford No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $36.65 No Bid No Bid
129 Mask, Anes. Feline small clear lexan cone w/flex. rubber diaphragm                                                       each No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.79 Bickford No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $36.65 No Bid No Bid
130 Mask, surgical                                                                                                                                      box No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.94 See Bid No Bid $2.52 No Bid No Bid $10.30 No Bid No Bid
131 Merial Imrab 3                                                                                                                                    50/tray No Bid Rabvac 3 $42.50 Agency No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132 Microscope, Cover slips 22x22mm   (glass)                                                                                            box No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.88 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid
133 Microscope, Lens Paper                                                                                                                       pack No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.88 No Bid No Bid $1.99 No Bid No Bid $0.80 No Bid No Bid
134 Microscope, Slides 3"x1"x1mm                                                                                                           72 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.84 No Bid No Bid $2.10 No Bid No Bid $1.71 No Bid No Bid
135 Miltex Instrument Cleaner                                                                                                                      8oz No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $5.84 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $5.88 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $6.70 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid
136 Miltex Lube Spray                                                                                                                                 8oz No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $5.84 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $5.18 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $6.70 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid
137 Needles, Excel 20g x 1"                                                                                                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138 Needles, Excel 20g x 1 1/2"                                                                                                               100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
139 Needles, Excel 21g x 1"                                                                                                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
140 Needles, Excel 22g x 1 1/2"                                                                                                               100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
141 Needles, Excel 22g x 1"                                                                                                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
142 Needles, Excel 25g x 5/8"                                                                                                                  100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified

143 Needles, Monoject 20g x 1"                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.49 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid $6.85 No Bid No Bid
144 Needles, Monoject 20g x 1 1/2"                                      100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.49 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid $6.85 No Bid No Bid
145 Needles, Monoject 21g x 1"                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.49 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid $6.85 No Bid No Bid
146 Needles, Monoject 22g x 1 1/2"                                    100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.49 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid $6.85 No Bid No Bid
147 Needles, Monoject 22g x 1"                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.49 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid $6.85 No Bid No Bid
148 Needles, Monoject 25g x 5/8"                                       100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.49 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid $6.85 No Bid No Bid
149 Needles, Nipro 18g x 1"                                                100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.89 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
150 Needles, Nipro 19g x 1"                                                100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151 Needles, Nipro 20g x 1"                                                100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.21 See Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
152 Needles, Nipro 20g x 1 1/2"                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.89 See Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
153 Needles, Nipro 21g x 1"                                                100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.89 See Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
154 Needles, Nipro 22g x 1 1/2"                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
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155 Needles, Nipro 22g x 1"                                                100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.21 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
156 Needles, Nipro 25g x 5/8"                                             100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.21 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
157 Nexaband S/C  1.5 ml                                                     bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.44 No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $19.60 No Bid No Bid
158 Oil, Immersion Type A                                                     120ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.27 No Bid No Bid $12.25 No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid
159 Oster Blade Wash                                                           each No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.26 No Bid No Bid $4.21 No Bid No Bid $4.50 No Bid No Bid
160 Oster Blades Cryotech A-5  size 5                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.01 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid $27.25 No Bid No Bid
161 Oster Blades Cryotech A-5  size 7                                  each No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.94 No Bid No Bid $23.50 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid
162 Oster Blades Cryotech A-5  size 10                                   each No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.58 No Bid No Bid $21.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid
163 Oster Blades Cryotech A-5  size 15                                   each No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.87 No Bid No Bid $21.50 No Bid No Bid $23.35 No Bid No Bid
164 Oster Blades Cryotech A-5  size 30                                   each No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.87 No Bid No Bid $23.50 No Bid No Bid $23.35 No Bid No Bid
165 Oster Blades Cryotech A-5  size 40                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.58 No Bid No Bid $21.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid
166 Oster Clipper Oil                                                               1/2 oz No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.21 No Bid No Bid $1.56 SP 11/9 No Bid $2.10 No Bid No Bid
167 Oster Kool Lube                                                                  each No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.29 No Bid No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid $5.65 No Bid No Bid
168 Penlites, disposable No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.68 No Bid No Bid $8.18 No Bid No Bid $7.25 No Bid No Bid
169 Pfizer Defensor 3                                                              50/tray No Bid Rabvac 3 $42.50 Agency No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
170 Pet Pillars                                                                          each No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.41 No Bid No Bid $10.75 No Bid No Bid $1.15 x12 = $13.80 No Bid
171 Poratable Cordless Cautery Kit w/replace. Tips No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.12 No Bid No Bid $48.99 No Bid No Bid $41.25 No Bid No Bid
172 Purevax Feline 3 (RCP)                                                     25/tray No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified

173 Purevax Feline 4 (RCCP)                                                25/tray No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
174 Purevax Feline Rabies                                                    25/tray No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
175 Purevax Ferret Distemper                                              10/tray No Bid No Bid No Bid Agency No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
176 Pyrantel Pamoate 50 mg/ml                                          32 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.59 No Bid No Bid $18.52 No Bid No Bid $22.91 No Bid No Bid
177 Revolution for cats 5-15 lbs                                            3 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid Direct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
178 Revolution for cats 5-15 lbs                                             6 pack                                          No Bid No Bid No Bid Direct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
179 Revolution for Puppy/Kitten under 5lbs                             3 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid Direct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
180 Roccal-D Plus Solution                                                     gallon No Bid Nolvasan $34.01 $65.62 No Bid No Bid $85.00 See Bid No Bid $65.62 No Bid No Bid
181 Shampoo, Aloe & Oatmeal                                                gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.20 No Bid No Bid
182 Shampoo, Chlorihexiderm Max 4%                                   gallon No Bid Nolvasan Shampoo $63.07 $73.59 No Bid No Bid $69.91 No Bid No Bid $53.60 No Bid No Bid
183 Shampoo, Oxydex                                                             gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.29 No Bid No Bid $70.58 No Bid No Bid $59.43 No Bid No Bid
184 Splint, Carpal Large                                                             each No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.06 No Bid No Bid $7.05 No Bid No Bid $7.50 No Bid No Bid
185 Splint, Carpal Medium                                                         each No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.35 No Bid No Bid $6.35 No Bid No Bid $6.75 No Bid No Bid
186 Splint, Carpal Small                                                             each No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.53 No Bid No Bid $5.65 No Bid No Bid $5.88 No Bid No Bid
187 Splint, Carpal Toy                                                                each No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.18 No Bid No Bid $5.25 No Bid No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid
188 Splint, Carpal, Extra-large                                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29 No Bid No Bid $8.25 No Bid No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid
189 Splint, Quick, Front Extra-large                                             each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
190 Splint, Quick, Front Large                                                      each No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.24 No Bid No Bid $14.55 SP 11/9 No Bid $15.20 No Bid No Bid
191 Splint, Quick, Front Medium                                                each No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.53 No Bid No Bid $11.75 SP No Bid $12.25 No Bid No Bid
192 Splint, Quick, Front Small                                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.88 No Bid No Bid $10.12 SP 11/9 No Bid $10.50 No Bid No Bid
193 Splint, Quick, Rear Extra-large                                           each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
194 Splint, Quick, Rear Large                                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.03 No Bid No Bid $11.76 No Bid No Bid $12.25 No Bid No Bid
195 Splint, Quick, Rear Medium                                                each No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.22 No Bid No Bid $9.88 No Bid No Bid $10.25 No Bid No Bid
196 Splint, Quick, Rear Small                                                    each No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.54 No Bid No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid $8.40 No Bid No Bid
197 Splint, Sam                                                                          each No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.94 No Bid No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid $13.75 No Bid No Bid
198 Stain, Dip Quick Kit Refills                                                  each No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.59 No Bid No Bid $40.95 No Bid No Bid $38.80 No Bid No Bid
199 Stain, Fluorescein single use strips                                        box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.68 No Bid No Bid $9.99 No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid
200 Stain, Urine Sediment                                                          each No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.78 No Bid No Bid $8.75 No Bid No Bid $7.90 No Bid No Bid
201 Staple Gun, 35 wide                                                             each No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.39 No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid
202 Sterile Lubricating Non-Spermicidal Jelly                                tube No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.59 No Bid No Bid $0.90 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid
203 Sterile Water for Injection                                                   250ml No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.82 No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid $2.15 No Bid No Bid
204 Sterile Water in Amber glass bottles                                     100ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid $1.85 No Bid No Bid
205 Strips, Azostix                                                                      box No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.32 No Bid No Bid $30.12 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid
206 Strips, Multistix 1-SG reagent                                              box No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.67 No Bid No Bid $30.75 No Bid No Bid $41.25 No Bid No Bid
207 Surgical Drape, Kendall 100 yards                                       each No Bid NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $65.84 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $70.56 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid $67.95 NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid
208 Suture, Ethilon 2-0 (FS Cutting) 664H                                 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $149.31 No Bid No Bid $135.42 No Bid No Bid $89.65 Kendall Suture No Bid
209 Suture, Ethilon 3-0 (FS-1 Cutting) 663H                              box No Bid No Bid No Bid $143.69 No Bid No Bid $145.12 No Bid No Bid $96.26 Kendall Suture No Bid

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified

210 Suture, Fluorofil 2-0 (FS Cutting) 860988                            box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.65 Biosyn No Bid
211 Suture, Fluorofil 3-0 (FS-1 Cutting) 860991                         box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.65 Biosyn No Bid
212 Suture, Monocryl 2-0 (FS-1 Cutting)  Y943H                        box No Bid No Bid No Bid $170.00 No Bid No Bid $183.00 No Bid No Bid $152.20 Biosyn No Bid
213 Suture, Monocryl 4-0 (FS-2 Cutting) Y922H                         box No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.99 No Bid No Bid $193.55 No Bid No Bid $143.45 Biosyn No Bid
214 Suture, Monocryl 3-0 (FS-2 Cutting) Y923H                         box No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.95 No Bid No Bid $185.45 No Bid No Bid $143.45 Biosyn No Bid
215 Suture, PDS II 2-0 (FS-1 Cutting) Z451H                             box No Bid No Bid No Bid $227.55 No Bid No Bid $199.38 See Bid See Bid $156.00 Biosyn/Maxon No Bid
216 Suture, PDS II 3-0 (FS-1 Cutting) Z452H                             box No Bid No Bid No Bid $227.75 No Bid No Bid $195.58 See Bid See Bid $143.45 Biosyn/Maxon No Bid
217 Suture, PDS II 4-0 (FS-2 Cutting) Z397H                             box No Bid No Bid No Bid $240.74 No Bid No Bid $202.15 See Bid See Bid $143.45 Biosyn/Maxon No Bid
218 Suture, PDS II 3-0 (FS-2 Cutting) Z398H                             box No Bid No Bid No Bid $227.68 No Bid No Bid $271.75 See Bid See Bid $143.45 Biosyn/Maxon No Bid
219 Suture, Vicryl 0 (FSL Cutting) J587H                                   box No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $144.61 Polysorb No Bid
220 Suture, Vicryl 1 (CP-1 Cutting) J468H                                 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $158.88 No Bid No Bid $155.00 No Bid No Bid $145.78 Polysorb No Bid
221 Suture, Vicryl 2-0 (FS-1 Cutting) J453H                              box No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.13 No Bid No Bid $163.32 See Bid See Bid $137.63 Polysorb No Bid
222 Suture, Vicryl 2-0 (X-1 Cutting) J461H                                 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $186.58 No Bid No Bid $169.85 No Bid No Bid $186.37 Vicryl No Bid
223 Suture, Vicryl 3-0 (FS-1 Cutting) J452H                              box No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.45 No Bid No Bid $211.00 See Bid See Bid $140.54 Polysorb No Bid
224 Suture, Vicryl 3-0 (FS-2 Cutting) J398H                              box No Bid No Bid No Bid $187.73 No Bid No Bid $213.80 See Bid See Bid $137.63 Polysorb No Bid
225 Syringe, Excel luer lock 12cc                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.38 Nipro No Bid
226 Syringe, Excel luer lock 1cc                                           100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.00 Nipro No Bid
227 Syringe, Excel luer lock 20cc                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.75 Nipro No Bid
228 Syringe, Excel luer lock 30cc                                         100/box                               No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 Nipro No Bid
229 Syringe, Excel luer lock 35cc                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.19 Nipro No Bid
230 Syringe, Excel luer lock 3cc                                           100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 Nipro No Bid
231 Syringe, Excel luer lock 60cc                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.94 Nipro No Bid
232 Syringe, Excel luer lock 6cc                                            100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.88 Nipro No Bid
233 Syringe, Monoject Oral Med 3ml                                     100/box  No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.84 No Bid No Bid $7.75 No Bid No Bid $10.45 Nipro No Bid
234 Syringe, Monoject Oral Med 6ml                                     100/box  No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.24 No Bid No Bid $8.10 No Bid No Bid $16.19 Nipro No Bid
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235 Syringe, Monoject luer lock 12cc                                    100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.79 box 80 No Bid $12.35 No Bid No Bid $9.38 Nipro No Bid
236 Syringe, Monoject luer lock 1cc                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.79 No Bid No Bid $10.95 No Bid No Bid $7.00 Nipro No Bid
237 Syringe, Monoject luer lock 20cc                                   100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.05 box 50 No Bid $18.05 No Bid No Bid $15.75 Nipro No Bid
238 Syringe, Monoject luer lock 30cc                                   100/box                      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid
239 Syringe, Monoject luer lock 35cc                                   100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.64 box30 No Bid $12.72 No Bid No Bid $19.19 No Bid No Bid
240 Syringe, Monoject luer lock 3cc                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.16 No Bid No Bid $7.95 No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid No Bid
241 Syringe, Monoject luer lock 60cc                                   100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.45 box 20 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $10.94 No Bid No Bid
242 Syringe, Monoject luer lock 6cc                                     100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.46 box 50 No Bid $8.25 No Bid No Bid $7.88 No Bid No Bid
243 Syringe, Nipro luer lock 12cc                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.50 No Bid No Bid $9.38 No Bid No Bid
244 Syringe, Nipro luer lock 1cc                                           100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.50 No Bid No Bid $7.00 No Bid No Bid
245 Syringe, Nipro luer lock 20cc                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.88 No Bid No Bid $15.75 No Bid No Bid
246 Syringe, Nipro luer lock 30cc                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified

247 Syringe, Nipro luer lock 35cc                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.25 30cc - 35cc No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid
248 Syringe, Nipro luer lock 3cc                                           100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.25 No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid No Bid
249 Syringe, Nipro luer lock 60cc                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.95 50cc - 60cc No Bid $10.94 No Bid No Bid
250 Syringe, Nipro luer lock 6cc                                           100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5cc $10.48 No Bid $7.88 No Bid No Bid
251 Syringe, Pole 3 foot                                                          each No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.18 No Bid No Bid $102.50 No Bid No Bid $33.88 No Bid No Bid
252 Tape Kit Set, Instrument Assorted Colors                           each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.95 No Bid No Bid $12.09 No Bid No Bid
253 Tape, Elastikon Porous 1" x 5 yds                                       box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $15.98 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $14.75 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $14.85 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
254 Tape, Elastikon Porous 2" x 5 yds                                       box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $15.98 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $14.75 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $14.85 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
255 Tape, Kendall Porous Adhesive 1" x 5 yds                          box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $11.25 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $11.70 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
256 Tape, Kendall Porous Adhesive 2" x 5 yds                          box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $11.25 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $11.70 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
257 Tape, Johnson & Johnson 1" x 5 yds                                  box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.50 No Bid No Bid $10.35 No Bid No Bid
258 Tape, Johnson & Johnson 2" x 5 yds                                  box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.50 No Bid No Bid $10.35 No Bid No Bid
259 Tear Test, Shirmer                                                              box No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.00 No Bid No Bid $43.76 No Bid No Bid $37.00 No Bid No Bid
260 Telfa Brand Non-Adherent Pads 3"x4"                                box No Bid NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $17.53 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $16.21 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid $16.94 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
261 Tubes, EDTA 2ml                                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.95 No Bid No Bid $13.46 No Bid No Bid
262 Tubes, EDTA 3ml                                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.88 No Bid No Bid $14.55 No Bid No Bid
263 Tubes, EDTA 5ml                                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.90 No Bid No Bid $14.95 No Bid No Bid
264 Tubes, EDTA 7ml                                                          100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.30 No Bid No Bid $16.20 No Bid No Bid
265 Tubes, Hematocrit                                                         100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.76 No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid No Bid
266 Tubes, Red top 2ml                                                       100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.52 No Bid No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid $12.95 No Bid No Bid
267 Tubes, Red top 3ml                                                       100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.52 No Bid No Bid $12.99 No Bid No Bid $13.40 No Bid No Bid
268 Tubes, Red top 5ml                                                       100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.09 No Bid No Bid $11.35 No Bid No Bid $13.15 No Bid No Bid
269 Tubes, Red top 7ml                                                       100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.09 No Bid No Bid $12.95 No Bid No Bid $13.55 No Bid No Bid
270 Tubes, Red top with serum separator 7ml                       100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
271 Tubes, Red and Gray with serum separator 7ml             100/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6ml $24.00 No Bid $26.06 No Bid No Bid
272 Vial Cobalt Blue 5 dram                                                   case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.90 No Bid No Bid
273 Vial Cobalt Blue 8.5 dram                                                case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.44 $28.20 No Bid No Bid
274 Vial Cobalt Blue 12 dram                                                 case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13 dram $33.43 $24.60 No Bid No Bid
275 Vial Cobalt Blue 16 dram                                                 case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.67 $22.70 No Bid No Bid
276 Vial Cobalt Blue 20 dram                                                 case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.46 $37.15 No Bid No Bid
277 Vial Cobalt Blue 30 dram                                                 case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.69 $34.65 No Bid No Bid
278 Vial Cobalt Blue 40 dram                                                 case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.28 $29.70 No Bid No Bid
279 Vials, 2 ounce amber plastic                                            dozen No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
280 Vials, 16 dram with twist secure lids                                  each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Substitutes Unit Price Unit Price Substitutes Unit Price Unit Price Substitutes Unit Price Unit Price Substitutes Unit Price
As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified

281 Vials, 4 dram with twist secure lids                                500/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
282 Vials, 5 dram with twist secure lids                                500/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
283 Vials, 6 dram with twist secure lids                                500/box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.90 No Bid No Bid
284 Y Piece 7/8" plastic                                                         each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.70 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid

Fort Dodge Animal Health MWI Veterinary Supply TW Medical Veterinary Supply Webster Veterinary

Substitutes

This is a preliminary summary of the bids as they were opened and announced at the bid opening. Bid prices have not been verified and are subject to change in the event mathematical errors are discovered during bid review.  Other information contained in this 
summary is also subject to review.

Witness:  Courtney Grosman 

Opening Agent:  Scott D. Johnson       

Substitutes

Equipment & Supplies

Equipment & Supplies Substitutes Substitutes
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