Bid 07-4167

DESCRIPTION

Lime rock, Uncrushed
Loaded into Vehicles

Lime rock, Crushed
Loaded into Vehicles

Stabilizer

Rock #89, 3/8”

Rock #57, ¥2" — ¥4"

Rip-Rap (6"-12")

Screenings

Sand Fill

Overburden Fill

Masonry Sand

DESCRIPTION

Lime rock, Uncrushed
Loaded into Vehicles
Delivery: Days ARO

Lime rock, Crushed
Loaded into Vehicles
Delivery: Days ARO

Stablizer
Delivery: Days ARO

Rock #89, 3/8"
Delivery: Days ARO

Rock #57, 1/2"-1/4"
Delivery: Days ARO

Rip-Rap (3"-7")
Deliery: Days ARO

Screenings
Delivery: Days ARO

Sand Fill
Delivery: Days ARO

Overburden Fill
Delivery: Days ARO

Agent:
Witness

Florida Dirt Source

PICKUP

PER

PICKUP LOCATIONS CU. YD

16000 Immokalee Rd.

16000 Immokalee Rd.

16000 Immokalee Rd.

16000 Immokalee Rd.

16000 Immokalee Rd.

16000 Immokalee Rd.

16000 Immokalee Rd.
16000 Immokalee Rd.

16000 Immokalee Rd.

N/A
Alternate Bid Item

Deposit for Transponder

DELIVERED

LOCATIONS

Insurance: Yes

$10.00

Unit

Each

PER
CU. YD

PER
TON

$ 6.00

$ 8.50

$ 8.00

$12.00

$12.00

$16.00

$10.00
$ 6.00

PER
TON

APAC Southeast, Inc.

PICKUP

PICKUP LOCATIONS

Golden Gate Quarry

Golden Gate Quarry

Golden Gate Quarry

Golden Gate Quarry

Golden Gate Quarry

Golden Gate Quarry

Alternate Bid Item

Deposit for Transponder

DELIVERED

LOCATIONS

Insurance: Yes

PER
CU. YD

PER
TON

$15.00

$15.00

NB

$19.00

$19.00

$28.00

$17.00
NB

NB
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=

Each

PER
CU. YD

PER
TON

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

NB

Florida Rock Industries
PICKUP

PER PER
PICKUP LOCATIONS CU.YD TON

N/A
Sunniland Mine
Highway 29 Sunniland $10.75
N/A
Fort Myers Quarry
14341 Alico Rd. $16.40
Fort Myers Quarry
14341 Alico Rd. $15.80
N/A
Fort Myers Quarry
14341 Alico Rd. $14.00
N/A
Sunniland Mine
Highway 29 Sunniland $ 5.75
Witherspoon Mine
11655 W SR78
Moorehaven, FL $ 8.65
Alternate Bid Item Unit Cost
Deposit for Transponder Each N/A
DELIVERED
PER PER
LOCATIONS CU.YD TON
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A

Insurance: Yes

Purchase of Lime Rock and Fill Material, Fixed Term Contract
Project Manager: Travis Gossard

Laverde Group, Inc.

PICKUP

PICKUP LOCATIONS

Bonita Grande

Bonita Grande

Jones Mining

Bonita Grande

Bonita Grande

Bonita Grande

Youngquist Brothers

APAC

Big Island

Youngquist Brothers

Alternate Bid Item

Deposit for Transponder

DELIVERED

LOCATIONS

Bonita Grande

Bonita Grande

Jones Mining

Bonita Grande

Bonita Grande

Bonita Grande

Youngquist Brothers

APAC

Big Island

Insurance: No

PER
CU. YD

$12.83

$12.38

$12.53

$18.33

$18.33

$24.44

$15.88
$ 9.16

$ 7.33

$12.22
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Each

PER
CU. YD

$ 8.55

$ 855

PER
TON

$10.50

$10.50

$10.25

$ 15.00

$ 15.00

$ 20.00

$ 13.00
$ 7.50

$ 6.00

$ 10.00
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PER
TON

$ 7.00

$ 7.00

$ 6.75

$ 6.00

$ 7.00

$ 7.00

$ 7.00

$7.00

Infinity Aggregate LLC
PICKUP

PER PER
PICKUP LOCATIONS CU.YD TON

45150 Bermont Rd.

Punta Gorda, FL $ 3.00 $ 257

45150 Bermont Rd. $ 3.00 $ 257
45150 Bermont Rd. $ 3.00 $ 257
Alternate Bid Item Unit Cost
Deposit for Transponder Each
DELIVERED
PER PER
LOCATIONS CU.YD TON
Infinity Aggregate

Punta Gorda - 2 days  $15.43 $13.23

Infinity Aggregate
2 days $15.43 $13.23
Infinity Aggregate
2 days $15.43 $13.23

Insurance: Yes

BQ Concrete
PICKUP

PICKUP LOCATIONS

APAC

Bonita Grande

Youngguist

Jones Mining

West Wing

Rinker

Big Island

Cemex

Big Island

Cemex
Alternate Bid ltem

Deposit for Transponder

DELIVERED

LOCATIONS

Bonita Grande

Bonita Grande

APAC

Youngquist

Bonita Grande

APAC

APAC

Youngquist

Jones Mining

Insurance: Yes

PER CU.
YD

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid
See bid

See bid

See bid
Unit

Each

PER CU.

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

See bid

PER TON

$ 8.00

$ 11.00

$ 7.00

$ 14.00

$ 15.00

$ 25.00

$ 14.75
$ 750

$ 8.00

$ 10.00
Cost

-0-

PER
TON

$ 8.50

$ 8.00

$ 750

$ 7.50

$ 7.50

$ 8.50

$ 7.50

$ 750

$ 7.50

Anakat Corp dba

Rymatt Golf

PICKUP

PICKUP LOCATIONS

Bonita Grande

Big Island Mine

Panther Mine

Bonita Grande

Youngquist Mine

Bonita Grande

Cemex/Corkscrew

Youngquist Mine

Stewart Mine

Rinker/Palmdale
Alternate Bid Item

Deposit for Transponder

DELIVERED

LOCATIONS

Bonita Grande

Big Island - 1 day

Panther - 1 day

Bonita Grande - 1 day

Youngquist - 1 day

Bonita Grande - 1 day

Cemex - 1 day

Youngquist - 1 day

Stewart - 1 day

Insurance: Yes

PER
CU. YD

$ 9.50

$ 4.50

$ 6.00
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Each

PER
CU. YD

$15.75

$13.50

$14.35

PER
TON

$11.50

$15.75

$14.95

$22.50

$12.75
$ 5.00

PER
TON

$16.25

$20.50

$20.95

$27.25

$18.50

$11.00

Notices Sent: 74
Bids Received: 8

Solomon Enterprices
LLC dba Eagle Dump
Truck

PICKUP

PICKUP LOCATIONS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Bid Item
Deposit for Transponder

DELIVERED

LOCATIONS

No Bid

Bonita - 2 days

Alico Rd. - 2 days

Bonita - 2 days

Alico Rd. or Bonita
2 days

Alico Rd. or Bonita
2 days

Alico Rd. or Bonita
2 days

Alico Rd. or
Moorehaven - 2 days

Alico Rd. - 2 days

Insurance: Yes

PER
CU. YD

Each

PER
CU. YD

$10.53

PER
TON

PER
TON

$15.20

$15.20

$19.45

$18.90

$21.50

$18.90

$14.90




