Project Mgr.: Wayne Watson

Date Posted: 8-6-

07

Date Due: 8-22-07

BID #07-4108R
"EMS Uniforms"
Addendums: 0

Notices Sent: 11

Packages Requested: 29

Bids Recevied: 4

Criminal Justice

Medical Department
Store and Discount

DESCRIPTION Uniforms & Supply Uniforms, Inc. PRIDE Enterprises RSVP LTD., Inc.

1. Fire Chief Insignia $6.00 $19.99 No Bid $4.00

2. Captain Insignia $6.00 $14.99 No Bid $4.00

3. Lieutenant Insignia $6.00 $14.99 No Bid $4.00

4. Jumpstit Epilets $8.00 No Bid No Bid $16.00
5. F.T.O. Insignia $6.00 $19.99 No Bid $12.37
6. Badge, Blackington #B537 $36.00 $55.00 No Bid $36.75
7. Badge, Blackington #B296 $39.00 $49.00 No Bid $45.00
8. Florida EMT Patch $1.00 $1.50 $0.85 See Bid
9. Florida Paramedic Patch $1.00 $1.50 $0.90 See Bid
10. Department Patch $2.00 $2.00 $1.45 See Bid
11. Department Firefighter Medic Patch $2.00 $2.00 $0.90 See Bid
12. Nameplate $16.00 $9.99 No Bid $10.50
13. Nameplate, with Serving since Pin $22.00 $9.99 No Bid $17.40
14. Black leather name tag No Bid $9.99 No Bid No Bid

15. American Flag Lapel Pin $2.50 $4.99 No Bid $1.50

16. Phoenix Pin (3/4") No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17. Polo shirt $39.00 $27.99 No Bid $28.75
18. Basket weave belt $29.20 $16.99 No Bid $25.00
19. Elbeco men's EMT trousers $37.39 $45.00 $27.64 $42.50
20. Elbeco women’s EMT trousers $37.39 $45.00 $27.64 $42.50
21. Elbeco men’s long sleeve blouse, blue $33.15 $29.99 See Bid $33.52
22. Elbeco men'’s short sleeve blouse, blue $29.42 $27.99 See Bid $30.52
23. Elbeco women'’s long sleeve blouse, blue $33.15 $29.99 See Bid $32.91
24. Elbeco women'’s short sleeve blouse, blue $29.42 $27.99 See Bid $27.99
25. Elbeco men’s long sleeve blouse, white $33.15 $29.99 See Bid $33.52
26. Elbeco men'’s short sleeve blouse, white $29.42 $27.99 See Bid $30.96
27. Elbeco women'’s long sleeve blouse, white $33.15 $29.99 See Bid $32.91
28. Elbeco women's short sleeve blouse, white $29.42 $27.99 See Bid $27.99
29. Elbeco Summit Lifesaver jacket $107.10 $125.00 No Bid No Bid

30. Liberty long sleeve blouse, light blue $29.15 $24.95 See Bid $21.95
31. Liberty short sleeve blouse, light blue $25.42 $24.25 See Bid $17.95
32. Liberty long sleeve blouse, white $29.15 $24.95 See Bid $21.95
33. Liberty short sleeve blouse, white $25.42 $24.25 See Bid $17.95
34. Liberty jacket with zip out lining $52.40 $49.99 No Bid $45.25
35. Liberty yellow raincoat $24.10 $19.99 No Bid $15.95
36. Martin’s EMT trousers No Bid $29.99 $27.64 $42.50
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37. Topps brush jacket in nomex $139.10 $139.00 $91.88 $112.32
38. Topps brush pants in nomex $124.10 $99.00 $104.20 $101.93
39. Jumpsuit $117.15 $119.00 No Bid $108.00
Prompt Payment Terms:| 5% 15 Days; Net 30 Days Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30 days
Addendums Acknowledged (Y/N): N/A N/A N/A N/A

Opening Agent: Scott D. Johnson

Witness: Courtney Grosman

This is a preliminary summary of the bids as they were opened and announced at the bid opening. Bid prices have not been verified and are subject to change in the event mathematical errors are

discovered during bid review. Other information contained in this summary is also subject to review.
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