	_	Dan Gammore							Dido I (CCC)
							<u> </u>		
Bid Opening: March 2, 2007		Metro Power Systems				United Rentals			
		Availability Delivery &			Weekly	Availability	Delivery &	T	Weekly
Equipment	Qty	Fee	Pick Up	Insurance	Rental Rate	Fee	Pick Up	Insurance	Rental Rate
*35KW Towable Diesel (Large) Generator Multi-phase, Multi-volt (26) weeks	12	\$4,056.00/ea	Metro invoiced cost plus 20%	13% of total rental cost	\$780.00/ea per week	Seee Bid	Seee Bid	Seee Bid	Seee Bid
Power distribution Systems, Cables, Grounding (26) weeks	12	\$1,085.66/ea	Metro invoiced cost plus 20%	13% of total rental cost	\$208.78/ea per week	Seee Bid	Seee Bid	Seee Bid	Seee Bid
4 Kw Portable generators (Small) gas or diesel with roll cage and extended run time	Per Unit	\$1,273.00/ea	Metro invoiced cost plus 20%	13% of total rental cost	\$165.00/ea per week	Seee Bid	Seee Bid	Seee Bid	Seee Bid
Totals									
PLAN TOTAL									
Equipment									
350KW	2	\$10,140.00/ea	Metro invoiced cost plus 20%	13% of total rental cost	\$1,950.00/ea per week	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid
750KW	2	\$23,660/ea	Metro invoiced cost plus 20%	13% of total rental cost	\$4,550.00/ea per week	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid
1200KW	1	\$40,560.00/ea	Metro invoiced cost plus 20%	13% of total rental cost	\$7,800.00/ea per week	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid
Power Distribution Systems, for each	5	See Bid	Metro invoiced cost plus 20%	13% of total rental cost	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid
Totals					See Bid				

Project Manager: Dan Summers Number of Notices Sent:62 Number Requesting Pkg: 10 Number of Bids Received:2

	United Rentals						
Hourly Rate	Overtime Rate	Mileage Rate (In County)	Per Diem	Hourly Rate	Overtime Rate	Mileage Rate (In County)	Per Diem
\$89.00/hr	\$133.50/hr	\$.95/per mile		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
\$178.00'hr				no bid			
Net 30 days				Net 30 days			
N				Y			
N/A				N/A			
	\$89.00/hr \$178.00'hr Net 30 days	## Metro Pov Hourly Rate	Rate Rate Rate Rate Rate (In County)	Metro Power Systems	Metro Power Systems	Metro Power Systems United	Metro Power Systems United Rentals